
Event Summary - Heavy Duty Outdoor Tables and Chairs
Type Invitation to Bid Number TAMU-ITB-2450
Stage Title  - Organization TAMU
Currency US Dollar Event Status Awarded
Work Group TAMU Exported on 8/20/2020
Exported by Cherise Toler For Requisition 134299399
Created Document 134784759 Estimated Value 1,450.00 USD
Payment Terms  -   

Bid and Evaluation
Respond by Proxy Allow Use Panel Questionnaire No
Sealed Bid Yes Auto Score No
  Cost Analysis No
Alternate Items No   

Visibility and Communication
Visible to Public Yes
Enter a short description for this public event
Texas A&M University is seeking bids for Heavy Duty, ADA Compliant, Outdoor tables and chairs.

Commodity Codes
None Added

Event Dates
Time Zone CDT/CST - Central Standard Time (US/Central)
Released  - 
Open 7/31/2020 12:00 AM CDT
Close 8/7/2020 10:00 AM CDT
Sealed Until 8/7/2020 10:00 AM
  Show Sealed Bid Open Date to Supplier 
Q&A Close 8/7/2020 10:00 AM CDT

Event Users
Event Creator
 

Cherise Toler
CTOLER@TAMU.EDU

Phone +1 979-845-5887
 

Event Owners
 

Cherise Toler
CTOLER@TAMU.EDU

Phone +1 979-845-5887

Patricia Winkler
P-WINKLER@TAMU.EDU

Phone +1 979-845-4556
Robert Bounds
RBOUNDS@TAMU.EDU

Phone +1 979-845-4534

Leann Harris
leann.harris@tamu.edu

Phone +1 979-845-2325
Randy Linder - Admin
randy-linder@tamu.edu

Phone +1 979-845-9018

Clyde Oberg
CO@TAMU.EDU

Phone +1 979-845-1042
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Paul Admin Barzak
p-barzak@tamu.edu

Phone +1 979-845-3816
 

Contacts
 

Cherise Toler
CTOLER@TAMU.EDU

Phone +1 979-845-5887
 

Stakeholders
 

Tonya Laird
T-LAIRD@TAMU.EDU

Phone +1 979-847-7334

Brandie Watson
B.WATSON@TAMU.EDU

Phone +1 979-845-8286

Clinton Merritt
c-merritt@tamu.edu
 

Marla Young
MEYOUNG@TAMU.EDU

Phone +1 979-845-2139
Laura Dainty
LDAINTY@TAMU.EDU

Phone +1 979-845-4579

Cherise Toler
CTOLER@TAMU.EDU

Phone +1 979-845-5887
Angelita Constancio
AGC@TAMU.EDU

Phone +1 979-845-3847

Stephen Wolfe
SWOLFE3@TAMU.EDU

Phone +1 979-845-4570
Tammy Prater
TPRATER@TAMU.EDU

Phone +1 979-845-0099

Sharon Parks
SHARONP@TAMU.EDU

Phone +1 979-845-4570

Christi Harris
LEANN.HARRIS@TAMU.EDU
 

Susan King
SA-KING@TAMU.EDU

Phone +1 979-845-3888
Heather Lupoli
HLUPOLI@TAMU.EDU

Phone +1 979-458-3513
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Texas A&M University is seeking bids for Heavy Duty, ADA Compliant, Outdoor tables and chairs.

Attention Bidders:

Texas A&M, Procurement Services is transitioning to an E-commerce system for all invitation for bids and 
purchase orders.  We are asking all vendors to take a few moments and register as one of our vendors.  This will 
allow you to respond to our bid invitations electronically as well as view other bid opportunities.
Please visit the following website to register:
https://bids.sciquest.com/apps/Router/PublicEvent?CustomerOrg=TAMU
If you have any questions in reference to registrations, please contact us at 979-845-2325.
***************************************
All invitation for bid documents not submitted electronically via the AggieBid system will only be accepted via 
the following methods:
-Email - tamuaggiebid@tamu.edu
-Express Mail (FedEx, UPS, etc.)
-US Postal Service
-Hand Delivered
All invitation for bid documents not submitted electronically via the AggieBid system must be returned on our 
form.  

As a bidder responding to this invitation upon submission of your response, regardless of the format of your 
submission, you and the entity you represent are agreeing to the terms and conditions presented here as well as 
the TAMU terms and conditions located 
at http://purchasing.tamu.edu/media/123743/bidtamu.pdf

Physical Address:

Texas A&M University 
Procurement Services 
Agronomy Road 
College Station TX 77843-1477 
Fax - 979-845-3800

Description

https://bids.sciquest.com/apps/Router/PublicEvent?CustomerOrg=TAMU
mailto:tamuaggiebid@tamu.edu
http://purchasing.tamu.edu/media/123743/bidtamu.pdf


Stage Description
No description available.



Prerequisites  Required to Enter Bid 

1  Instructions To Supplier : 
 

 Please acknowledge that additional terms and conditions have been reviewed.
 

 

 Certification
 I certify that I have read and agree to the terms above.
 Supplier Must Also Upload a File:
 No
 Prerequisite Content:



In accordance with Texas Education Code 51.9335, Texas A&M University shall make the award based on, but not limited to, the 
following best value criteria:

 The purchase price;
 The reputation of the vendor and of the vendor's goods or services;
 The quality of the vendor's goods or services;
 The extent to which the goods or services meet the institution's needs;
 The vendor's past relationship with the institution;
 The impact on the ability of the institution to comply with laws and rules relating to historically underutilized businesses and to the 

procurement of goods and services from persons with disabilities;
 The total long-term cost to the institution of acquiring the vendor's goods or services;
 Any other relevant factor that a private business entity would consider in selecting a vendor; and
 The use of material in construction or repair to real property that is not proprietary to a single vendor unless the institution provides written 

justification in the request for bids for use of the unique material specified.

Other relevant factors deemed necessary to evaluate the offer and determine the best value for the University:

 Vendor’s ability to meet the minimum specifications;
 Delivery requirement;
 The quality, availability and adaptability of equipment offered to required application.
 Warranty Terms; 
 Acceptance of standard payment terms;

By submitting a bid in response to this solicitation, bidder agrees to the selection and award process, and accepts Texas A&M 
University’s judgment and decision of award. 

Texas A&M reserves the right to accept or reject any or all bids, waive informalities and technicalities, and accept the offer considered 
the most advantageous to the University. 

Texas A&M reserves the right to make the decision as to the system, product or service best meets the minimum specifications and 
best suits the needs of the University.  The decision by Texas A&M University is final.



Buyer Attachments
TAMU Standard Terms and ConditionsTAMU.BID.TERMS.pdf ../Attachments/TAMU.BID.TERMS.pd

f

TAMU HUB Subcontracting Plan Form - FY20HUB Subcontracting Plan Form - 
TAMU FY20.pdf

../Attachments/HUB Subcontracting 
Plan Form - TAMU FY20.pdf

REVISED Detailed Specifications 8.6.20 - TABLES AND CHAIRS - 
Revised.docx

../Attachments/8.6.20 - TABLES AND 
CHAIRS - Revised.docx

Addendum Addendum.pdf ../Attachments/Addendum.pdf
Addendum #2 Addendum 2.doc ../Attachments/Addendum 2.doc

Second Revision - Detailed Specifications8.6.20 - TABLES AND CHAIRS - 
Revision.docx

../Attachments/8.6.20 - TABLES AND 
CHAIRS - Revision.docx



Questions  Supplier Response Is Required 

Page 1
Group 1

1.1
Delivery Terms: Quote best delivery time.  The University prefers to have at least partial 
delivery on or before August 17, 2020.  Best delivery time is a major factor in award of this 
bid. Vendor to quote best delivery time, either partial or in whole, even if the desired delivery 
is not attainable. 

 Text (Multi-Line)
 

1.2
Shipping Terms: Quote Destination Freight Prepaid and Allowed. If quoting as specified, type
"Agreed" in the required field. If quoting otherwise, indicate here-in and provide estimated 
shipping cost. 

 Text (Single Line)
 

1.3 Payment Terms - Quote 100% Net 30 Upon Receipt, Installation and Acceptance. If quoting 
as specified, type "Agreed" in the required field. If quoting otherwise, indicate here-in. 

 Text (Single Line)
 

1.4 Vendor to indicate contact person and contact phone and fax numbers where orders are to 
be placed: Contact: Telephone Number: Fax Number: Email: 

 Text (Multi-Line)
 

1.5 Warranty Terms - indicate warranty terms offered 
 Text (Single Line)
 

1.6
Vendor to certify that attached Detailed Specifications document has been read thoroughly 
and is understood.  Vendor certifies that product offered meets these minimum 
specifications. 

 Yes/No
 

1.7 The University needs 870 chairs and 580 tables.  20% must meet ADA compliance.  
Understood? yes/no 

 Yes/No
 

1.8 Vendor to certify that detailed product information/part numbers/etc have been included with 
bid response. 

 Yes/No
 

1.9 Vendor to acknowledge receipt and acceptance of the attached Addendum and Revised 
Detailed Specifications. 

 Yes/No
 

1.10 Second Addendum attached 8.3.2020 at 12:30 p.m. CST - Vendor to acknowledge: 
 Yes/No



  Required Product Line 
Items 

Product Line Items  Estimated Delivery Date is
Required 

Group P1

# Item Name, Commodity 
Code, Description Qty. UOM Target Price Allow 

Alternates
Requested 
Delivery

P1.1
Heavy Duty Outdoor 
Tables - As per 
attached detailed 
specifications 

 - EA - Each  -   - 

 
56101600 - Outdoor furniture | 5752 <$5k, 8424 / LIST EXTENDED PRICE IN "NOTES" SECTION - 
BASED ON UNIT PRICE AND QUANTITY OFFERED
MUST include make/model information and product literature

P1.2
Heavy Duty Outdoor 
Chairs As per attached
detailed specifications 

 - EA - Each  -   - 

 
56101600 - Outdoor furniture | 5752 <$5k, 8424 / LIST EXTENDED PRICE IN "NOTES" SECTION - 
BASED ON UNIT PRICE AND QUANTITY OFFERED
MUST include make/model information and product literature

P1.3
ADA Complaint Heavy
Duty Outdoor Chair As
per attached detailed 
specifications 

 - EA - Each  -   - 

 LIST EXTENDED PRICE IN "NOTES" SECTION - BASED ON UNIT PRICE AND QUANTITY OFFERED
MUST include make/model information and product literature

P1.4
ADA Compliant Heavy
Duty Outdoor Table - 
As per attached 
detailed specifications 

 - EA - Each  -   - 

 LIST EXTENDED PRICE IN "NOTES" SECTION - BASED ON UNIT PRICE AND QUANTITY OFFERED
MUST include make/model information and product literature

P1.5 Delivery 1 LO - Lot  -   - 
 Provide DETAILED delivery information - quantity delivered by x dated, etc.



Service Line Items
There are no Items added to this event.



Price Components
There are no Price Components added to this event.



Suppliers
AUDIO-VISUAL AIDS COMPANY
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
jbonham@audiovisualaids.com

 

 

AWARDS OF DISTINCTION, INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
mv@awardsofdistinction.com

 

 

FURNITURE BY WILLIAM WEBB (Furniture by William Webb)
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
furniturebywilliam@gmail.com

 

 

ALPHA MATERIALS HANDLING, INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
cathy@alphamh.com

 

 

Hispanic Contractors Association de San Antonio
Progress Event Not Viewed

HCA Admin
admin@hcadesa.org

 

 

TEJAS OFFICE PRODUCTS INC
Progress No Bid

Brian Hall
Brian.Hall@Staples.com

Sales Sales
csr@tejasoffice.com

Adriane Williams
Adriane.williams@staples.com

Crystal Ikeakor
crystal.ikeakor@staples.com

 

El Paso Hispanic Chamber of Commerce
Progress Event Not Viewed

Terri Reed
treed@ephcc.org

 

 

ALBRECHT INCORPORATED
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
kitty@albrechtinc.net

 

 

SPECTRUM PAPER CO., INC.
Progress Intention Not Declared

 
maxine@spectrumpaper.com

Maxine Brown-Soto
customerservice@spectrumpaper.com

 

PDME - Office Depot
Progress Event Not Viewed
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mailto:Brian.Hall@Staples.com
mailto:csr@tejasoffice.com
mailto:Adriane.williams@staples.com
mailto:crystal.ikeakor@staples.com
mailto:treed@ephcc.org
mailto:kitty@albrechtinc.net
mailto:maxine@spectrumpaper.com
mailto:customerservice@spectrumpaper.com


Stephen Roy
sroy@pdme.com

 

 

Challenge Office Products, Inc.
Progress Event Not Viewed

John Barbosa
jbarbosa@challengeofficeproducts.com

MaryAnne Talab
maryanne@challengeofficeproducts.com

 

BPTS LLC
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
bpts1@outlook.com

 

 

NEOPOST USA INC.
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
government@neopost.com

 

 

BLUEROCK CG, LLC
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
daniel@bluerockcg.com

 

 

AHI ENTERPRISES, LLC
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
MARK@NOLANSONLINE.COM

 

 

BND ARCHITECTURAL WOODWORK,L.L.C.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
jose@bndarchitectural.com

 

 

BANDY, INCORPORATED
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
aaron@bandyco.com

 

 

Champion Supply Co LLC
Progress Submitted

Total Bid 203,311.68

Mandy Zendejas
mandyz1111@gmail.com

 

 

CASADA INDUSTRIAL
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
sales@casadaind.com

 

 

CBT SUPPLY, INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted
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mailto:maryanne@challengeofficeproducts.com
mailto:bpts1@outlook.com
mailto:government@neopost.com
mailto:daniel@bluerockcg.com
mailto:MARK@NOLANSONLINE.COM
mailto:jose@bndarchitectural.com
mailto:aaron@bandyco.com
mailto:mandyz1111@gmail.com
mailto:sales@casadaind.com


 
jkorber@smartdesks.com

 

 

CACO MANUFACTURING CORPORATION
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
randall@solomatic.com

 

 

BUSINESS ENVIRONMENTS
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
bhoover@businessenvironments.com

 

 

Total Recreation Products
Progress No Bid

 
kelly@totalrecreation.net

 

 

COMMONWEALTH COMPUTER COMPANY, INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
cwealth@commonwealthcomputer.com

 

 

IN DEPTH EVENTS, INC.
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
robert@indepth.events

 

 

Tri-County Regional Black Chamber of Commerce (Tri-County Regional Black Chamber of Commerce)
Progress Event Not Viewed

Leondria Thompson
procurement@tcbcc.org

 

 

COMOTION LLC, DBA CALIFORNIA CHAIR
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
rh@cachair.com

 

 

Worthington Direct Holdings, LLC
Progress No Bid

 
neely@worthingtondirect.com

 

 

CHARMAINE WYNTER INTERIORS INC
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
Info@charmainewynter.com

 

 

RFx Analyst
Progress Intention Not Declared
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Kelly Johnson
rfp@rfxanalyst.com

 

 

CLEANING SOLUTIONS, INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
thorntn@airmail.net

 

 

ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
bids@icswaco.com

 

 

GOMEZ FLOOR COVERING, INC.
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
rwhitener@gomezfc.com

 

 

NELSON INTERIORS, LLC
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
Emily@nelsoninteriors.com

 

 

HOUSTON MINORITY SUPPLIER DEVELOPMENT COUNCIL
Progress Event Not Viewed

Angela Freeman
angela.freeman@hmsdc.org

 

 

Correctional Technologies Inc (Cortech USA)
Progress Intention Not Declared

 
steve@CortechUSA.com

 

 

K. HANES INCORPORATED (BJ's Park& Recreation Products)
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
kevin@bjspark.com

 

 

SCANDINAVIAN SPACES
Progress Intention Not Declared

 
ar@scandinavianspaces.com

 

 

Boulder Designs
Progress No Bid

David Downs
david@bordermagic.com

 

 

Southwest Minority Supplier Development Council
Progress Event Not Viewed
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Noelle Flowers
noelle@smsdc.org

 

 

AHI ENTERPRISES LLC
Progress Event Not Viewed

Desnise Nolan
DENISE@NOLANSONLINE.COM

Mark A. Nolan Nolan
mark@ahitexas.com

 

SNA SPORTS GROUP LLC (SNA Sports Group, LLC)
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
info@SNAsportsgroup.com

 

 

SOUGHT FOUND LLC
Progress Intention Not Declared

 
jeff@sandfllc.com

 

 

MAVICH, LLC
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
SALES@MAVICH.COM

 

 

CAN-AM WIRELESS, LLC
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
jrahardjo@canamwireless.com

 

 

OPEX CORPORATION (OPEX Corporation)
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
vregistration@opex.com

 

 

ADVANTAGE SUPPLY
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
deals@advantagesupply.us

 

 

ABVENTURE DESIGNS, LLC
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
adrienne@abventuredesigns.com

 

 

SONIC TOOTHBRUSH AND DENTAL
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
lucinni@urslogo.com

 

 

ABER FENCE AND SUPPLY C.
Progress Event Not Viewed
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bids@aberfence.com

 

 

LAVACA COUNTY OFFICE SUPPLY, INC. (South Texas School Furniture)
Progress Intend To Bid

 
lauraj@texaslibrary.com

 

 

TIPTOP TURNKEY LLC
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
sam@tiptopturnkey.com

 

 

CUEVAS DISTRIBUTION, INC.
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
ycuevas@cuevasdistribution.com

 

 

MEDRX COMPOUNDING & PHARMACY LLC
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
lyndasarpong@yahoo.com

 

 

WEST TEXAS LIGHTHOUSE FOR THE BLIND (West Texas Lighthouse for the Blind)
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
j.glaze@lighthousefortheblind.org

 

 

BOBTACK LLC (BobTack LLC)
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
bobbyt@bobtack.com

 

 

NEUTRAL POSTURE, INC.
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
corear@neutralposture.com

 

 

PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS)
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
bids@pyramidsp.com

 

 

Brazos Valley Contractors Assoc
Progress Intention Not Declared

KAYLA GLOVER
bvcaplanroom@gmail.com

 

 

Texas Association of African American Chamber of Commerce (TAAACC)
Progress Event Not Viewed
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Charles O'Neal
info@TAAACC.org

 

 

GATEWAY PRINTING & OFFICE SUPPLY, INC.
Progress Response In Progress

 
butch@gatewayp.com

 

 

DIRECT SUPPLY INC
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
bids@directs.com

 

 

RA Design Studio LLC
Progress Submitted

Total Bid 691,679.00

 
tameka.robins@radesignstudious.com

 

 

HCONE INTERNATIONAL IMPEX LLC (HCONE International IMPEX Inc)
Progress Intention Not Declared

 
edkabutey@hconecompanies.com

 

 

Forms and Surfaces
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
carey.davis@forms-surfaces.com

 

 

SITMATIC (Sitmatic)
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
mark@sitmatic.com

 

 

ONE DIVERSIFIED, LLC (Diversified LLC)
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
mdichirico@diversifiedus.com

 

 

TDKFE LLC (BoxDrop BCS)
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
bristol.boxdropcstat@gmail.com

 

 

ART HALL AWARDS (Art Hall Awards)
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
bill@arthallawards.com

 

 

SCHOOL OUTFITTERS
Progress Response In Progress
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contracts@schooloutfitters.com

 

 

T.S.P. Holding Co. (Today's Patio)
Progress Submitted

Total Bid 297,630.00

Craig Scheinerman
craig@todayspatio.com

 

 

TEXACRAFT WINSTON CONTRACT DBA
Progress Submitted

Total Bid 325,475.00

Jerry Leigh
jleigh@texacraft.com

 

 

CHARM-TEX INC
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
stan@charm-tex.com

 

 

Telescope Casual Furniture
Progress Intend To Bid

Matt Pisani
MPISANI@TELESCOPECASUAL.COM

 

 

ELB US Inc.
Progress No Bid

 
b.campion@elbglobal.com

 

 

BOB BARKER COMPANY, INC.
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
bidnotices@bobbarker.com

 

 

DGJD, INC.
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
dgjdmaatsch@aol.com

 

 

EDUCATOR'S DEPOT INC
Progress Submitted

Total Bid 481,484.10

Gaye Sales
gaye@educatorsdepot.com

Alan Clarke
customerservice@educatorsdepot.com

Jesse Jiminez
jjiminez@educatorsdepot.com

 

 

Georgetown Woodworks, LLC
Progress No Bid
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lang@gtownww.com

 

 

ABERDEEN ROAD CO/HERCULITE PRODUCTS, INC
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
cdeller@herculite.com

 

 

LOOSE CANNON INDUSTRIES LLC
Progress Intention Not Declared

 
inez@loosecannonatx.com

 

 

CC DISTRIBUTORS, INC.
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
ddesantos@ccdistributors.com

 

 

STEEL FIXTURE MFG CO
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
SALES@STEELFIXTURE.COM

 

 

DEWITT POTH & SON
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
sales@dewittpoth.com

 

 

THE TRADE GROUP, LLC
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
dbodin@tradegroup.com

 

 

R W GONZALEZ OFFICE PRODUCTS INC. (Gonzalez Solutions for Business)
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
mary@gonzalezop.com

 

 

Texas Association of Mexican American Chamber of Commerce (TAMACC)
Progress Event Not Viewed

Pauline Anton
panton@TAMACC.org

 

 

GLOBAL EQUIPMENT/ INDUSTRIAL (Global Industrial)
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
dhimelick@globalindustrial.com

 

 

SIMBA INDUSTRIES
Progress Intention Not Declared
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Vickie Kasten
sales@simbaindustries.com

 

 

Iris Info Pvt Ltd
Progress Intention Not Declared

John Wick
m6rul@wimsg.com

 

 

MCKESSON MEDICAL-SURGICAL MINNESOTA
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
government.bids@mckesson.com

 

 

VARI SALES CORPORATION
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
vendorportalregistration@varidesk.com

 

 

PEERLESS EVENTS & TENTS BRATT PRODUCTIONS INC DBA
Progress No Bid

Brian Olsen
briano@peerlesshouston.com

 

 

BSN SPORTS
Progress Response In Progress

 
bsnbid@bsnsports.com

 

 

BIOFIT ENGINEERED PRODUCTS (LIMITED PARTNERSHIP)
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
brian.schultz@biofit.com

 

 

The PlanIt Room
Progress Intention Not Declared

Cecila Hernandez
projects@theplanitroom.com

 

 

VANGUARD ENVIRONMENTS INC (Vanguard Environments)
Progress Response In Progress

Gayle Smith
gayle@vanguardenvironments.com

Mike Johnson
mike@vanguardenvironments.com

 

Texas Office Products LLC
Progress Event Not Viewed

Matthew Hahn
matthew@topstexas.com

Jessica Rose
jessica@topstexas.com

 

MUSEUM FABRICATION GROUP LLC (Museum Fabrication Group)
Progress Intention Not Declared
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mailto:bsnbid@bsnsports.com
mailto:brian.schultz@biofit.com
mailto:projects@theplanitroom.com
mailto:gayle@vanguardenvironments.com
mailto:mike@vanguardenvironments.com
mailto:matthew@topstexas.com
mailto:jessica@topstexas.com


 
info@museumfg.com

 

 

Asian Contractor Association
Progress Event Not Viewed

Aletta Sung
asiancontractor@gmail.com

 

 

LAKESHORE LEARNING MATERIALS
Progress No Bid

 
biddept@lakeshorelearning.com

 

 

OFFICESOURCE, LTD. (OfficeSource Ltd)
Progress Submitted

Total Bid 1,205,408.20

 
kay@o-ltd.net

JC Fiorino
jc@o-ltd.net

 

HASKELL OFFICE, LLC
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
tkerfien@haskelloffice.com

 

 

THE FURNITURE PEOPLE
Progress Intention Not Declared

Wilfrido CHAVEZ
willie@thefurnitureppl.com

 

 

PSS Industrial Group Corp (Industrial Air Tool)
Progress Intention Not Declared

Ernie Granato
egranato@sbcglobal.net

 

 

NORIX GROUP, INC.
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
furniture@norix.com

 

 

EASTCREEK DESIGNS, LLC
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
maripat@eastcreekdesigns.com

 

 

HBI OFFICE SOLUTIONS INC
Progress Submitted

Total Bid 516,974.80

Jennifer Greeley
jennifer@hbi-inc.com

Susan Ellis
susan@hbi-inc.com

 

PDME INC PD MORRISON ENTERPRISES INC DBA

mailto:info@museumfg.com
mailto:asiancontractor@gmail.com
mailto:biddept@lakeshorelearning.com
mailto:kay@o-ltd.net
mailto:jc@o-ltd.net
mailto:tkerfien@haskelloffice.com
mailto:willie@thefurnitureppl.com
mailto:egranato@sbcglobal.net
mailto:furniture@norix.com
mailto:maripat@eastcreekdesigns.com
mailto:jennifer@hbi-inc.com
mailto:susan@hbi-inc.com


Progress Event Not Viewed

Sales Sales
service@pdme.com

 
schastain@pdme.com

 

Regional Hispanic Contractors Association (RHCA)
Progress Event Not Viewed

Julio Florez
julio@regionalhca.org

 

 

BRAZOS JANITORIAL SUPPLY COMPANY, INC. (Brazos Janitorial Supply Company)
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
tdavis103@att.net

 

 

DEBNER
Progress Awarded

Total Bid 713,717.76

Total Awarded 683,716.76 USD

 
juliah@debner.com

 

 

Herman Packaging Company
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
info@hermanpackaging.com

 

 

INDUSTRIES FOR THE BLIND
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
amanda.pair@ibsupply.com

 

 

US Pan Asian American Chamber of Commerce SW (None)
Progress Event Not Viewed

Grace McDermott
gmcdermott@uspaacc-sw.org

 

 

HALL COMPANY FIVE, LLC DBA JODAC
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
timberly@jodac.com

 

 

NCO KNOWLEDGE LLC (NCO Websites)
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
ncowebsites@outlook.com

 

 

ERGOGENESIS WORKPLACE SOLUTIONS, LLC
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
orodriguez@ergogenesis.com

 

 

mailto:service@pdme.com
mailto:schastain@pdme.com
mailto:julio@regionalhca.org
mailto:tdavis103@att.net
mailto:juliah@debner.com
mailto:info@hermanpackaging.com
mailto:amanda.pair@ibsupply.com
mailto:gmcdermott@uspaacc-sw.org
mailto:timberly@jodac.com
mailto:ncowebsites@outlook.com
mailto:orodriguez@ergogenesis.com


VELOCITY OFFICE PRODUCTS (Velocity Business Products)
Progress Event Not Viewed

Dylan Pedigo
dlp@velocitybp.com

 

 

WILTON'S OFFICEWORKS LTD
Progress Response In Progress

K Graves
kgraves@wiltons.com

Stan Wilton
swilton@wiltons.com

 

MIDWEST OFFICE SUPPY
Progress Response In Progress

 
richard.finn@mofsupply.com

 

 

WW GRAINGER INC (Grainger)
Progress Event Not Viewed

Cyndee Wehrheim
cyndee.wehrheim@grainger.com

Tiffany Williams
tiffany.1.williams@grainger.com

 

WOOD MEDICAL SUPPLY
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
WOODMEDICAL@AOL.COM

 

 

WILSON PROJECT MANAGEMENT LLC
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
SmitheyL@wilson-pm.com

 

 

SOUTHWEST SOLUTIONS GROUP
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
bjohnston@southwestsolutions.com

 

 

Helios Digital Packaging
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
sales@heliosdigitalpackaging.com

 

 

North America Procurement Council, Inc. PBC
Progress Intention Not Declared

Lyra de Asis
lyra@napc.me

 

 

1I GROUP, LLC
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
easton@1igroup.com

 

 

HOUSTON CHEM SAFE, INC. DBA HCS SUPPLIES (HCS Supplies)

mailto:dlp@velocitybp.com
mailto:kgraves@wiltons.com
mailto:swilton@wiltons.com
mailto:richard.finn@mofsupply.com
mailto:cyndee.wehrheim@grainger.com
mailto:tiffany.1.williams@grainger.com
mailto:WOODMEDICAL@AOL.COM
mailto:SmitheyL@wilson-pm.com
mailto:bjohnston@southwestsolutions.com
mailto:sales@heliosdigitalpackaging.com
mailto:lyra@napc.me
mailto:easton@1igroup.com


Progress Event Not Viewed

 
mary@houstonchemsafe.com

 

 

THE PLAYWELL GROUP, INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
james@playwellgroup.com

 

 

THE LUCK COMPANY
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
JERE@THELUCKCOMPANY.COM

 

 

THE LYSANDER ELEMENT
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
diannzackery@hughes.net

 

 

TEXAS RESTAURANT EQUIPMENT EXCHANGE INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
KRIS@TXREST.COM

 

 

THE JACKSON FURNITURE GROUP
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
icemanterm45@hotmail.com

 

 

ACP DIRECT
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
bids@acpdirect.com

 

 

TECHCENTER DESIGN INC
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
loretta@techcenterdesign.com

 

 

TEXAS CORRECTIONAL INDUSTRIES
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
tci@tdcj.texas.gov

 

 

PRIDE ENTERPRISES (PRIDE Enterprises)
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
bids@pride-enterprises.org

 

 

UNIVERSAL PEN & PRINT, INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

mailto:mary@houstonchemsafe.com
mailto:james@playwellgroup.com
mailto:JERE@THELUCKCOMPANY.COM
mailto:diannzackery@hughes.net
mailto:KRIS@TXREST.COM
mailto:icemanterm45@hotmail.com
mailto:bids@acpdirect.com
mailto:loretta@techcenterdesign.com
mailto:tci@tdcj.texas.gov
mailto:bids@pride-enterprises.org


 
dhernandez@cubie.co

 

 

EVCO PARTNERS, L.P. DBA (Burgoon Company)
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
office@burgooncompany.com

 

 

TRENZY LLC
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
george@rfplus.com

 

 

TURNKEY HOSPITALITY SOLUTIONS LLC
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
curvehospitality@gmail.com

 

 

TREEPOINT LLC
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
jee@dhospitality.com

 

 

Pak Factory
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
sales@pakfactory.com

 

 

GLOBE OFFICE PRODUCTS (Globe Office Products)
Progress Response In Progress

 
globeoff@hotmail.com

 

 

TOTAL OFFICE SOLUTIONS
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
CHRISTINE@MYTOTALOFFICE.COM

 

 

SevenOutsource
Progress Intention Not Declared

Steve Walse
rfpalerts@gmail.com

 

 

VISUAL TECHNIQUES INC
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
jimmy@vtitx.com

 

 

SiteScapes, Inc.
Progress Submitted

Total Bid 611,405.00

mailto:dhernandez@cubie.co
mailto:office@burgooncompany.com
mailto:george@rfplus.com
mailto:curvehospitality@gmail.com
mailto:jee@dhospitality.com
mailto:sales@pakfactory.com
mailto:globeoff@hotmail.com
mailto:CHRISTINE@MYTOTALOFFICE.COM
mailto:rfpalerts@gmail.com
mailto:jimmy@vtitx.com


Hannah Jacobs
Hannah@sitescapesonline.com

 

 

SAN ANTONIO INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
SALES@SA-INDUSTRIAL.COM

 

 

SANISAFE PRODUCTS
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
ray.baldwin@sanisafeusa.com

 

 

KAPLAN EARLY LEARNING COMPANY (Kaplan Early Learning Company)
Progress Intention Not Declared

 
bids@kaplanco.com

 

 

REGAL PLASTIC SUPPLY COMPANY, INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
jkalmbach@regal-plastics.com

 

 

RENTAL WORLD, L.L.C.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
AWolf@RentalWorld.com

 

 

R.E.D. CONSTRUCTION, INC. DBA
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
ruben@3vcompany.com

 

 

SICAMOUR FURNITURE LLC
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
sicamourfurniture@gmail.com

 

 

SIGMA SURVEILLANCE INC.  DBA STS 360
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
john@sts360.com

 

 

Best Litter Receptacles, Inc
Progress Response In Progress

William Chicoine
bestlitter@atmc.net

 

 

SHELTON-KELLER GROUP, INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

mailto:Hannah@sitescapesonline.com
mailto:SALES@SA-INDUSTRIAL.COM
mailto:ray.baldwin@sanisafeusa.com
mailto:bids@kaplanco.com
mailto:jkalmbach@regal-plastics.com
mailto:AWolf@RentalWorld.com
mailto:ruben@3vcompany.com
mailto:sicamourfurniture@gmail.com
mailto:john@sts360.com
mailto:bestlitter@atmc.net


 
dkeller@skgtexas.com

 

 

COURTYARD CREATIONS (Courtyard Creations)
Progress Intend To Bid

 
jeffdowling@att.net

 

 

SHI GOVERNMENT SOLUTIONS, INC
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
Texas@SHI.com

 

 

XYPLES, LLC
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
tokonkwor@xyples.com

 

 

SCHOOL EXCESS INC
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
sales@schoolexcess.com

 

 

SANTA ANNA GLASS & MIRROR LLC
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
santaannaglass@gmail.com

 

 

1ST CHOICE RESTAURANT EQUIPMENT & SUPPLY
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
orders@1stchoiceres.com

 

 

SKG
Progress No Bid

Lisa Hermes
lhermes@skgtexas.com

 

 

Corrugated Concepts and Packaging
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
sales@corrcon.com

 

 

3FM, LLC DBA LONESTAR DELIVERY & PROCESS
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
rfrost@datarush.com

 

 

180 OFFICE SOLUTIONS, LLC
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

mailto:dkeller@skgtexas.com
mailto:jeffdowling@att.net
mailto:Texas@SHI.com
mailto:tokonkwor@xyples.com
mailto:sales@schoolexcess.com
mailto:santaannaglass@gmail.com
mailto:orders@1stchoiceres.com
mailto:lhermes@skgtexas.com
mailto:sales@corrcon.com
mailto:rfrost@datarush.com


 
wyatt@180office.com

 

 

SNAP ON TOOLS
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
charles.d.allen@snapon.com

 

 

Space Age Laminating & Bindery
Progress Event Not Viewed

April Day
bids@wbea-texas.org

 

 

Koa Solutions LLC
Progress Intention Not Declared

 
info@homeofficesusa.com

 

 

SM FABRICATION & REPAIR, LLC
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
SMFabrication@outlook.com

 

 

SLEEPTRONIC SLEEP PRODUCTS
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
contracts@sleeptronic.com

 

 

FOLIOT FURNITURE PACIFIC INC
Progress Event Not Viewed

Sales Sales
procurement@foliot.com

 

 

TADT, LLC
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
tadt@tadt-yourmove.com

 

 

ACCESS SUPPLY LLC
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
rduffer@accessupply.com

 

 

ABLES-LAND, INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
julie@ablesland.com

 

 

SHELTON-KELLER GROUP INC (SKG)
Progress No Bid

mailto:wyatt@180office.com
mailto:charles.d.allen@snapon.com
mailto:bids@wbea-texas.org
mailto:info@homeofficesusa.com
mailto:SMFabrication@outlook.com
mailto:contracts@sleeptronic.com
mailto:procurement@foliot.com
mailto:tadt@tadt-yourmove.com
mailto:rduffer@accessupply.com
mailto:julie@ablesland.com


Kayla Allen
kallen@skgtexas.com

 

 

A-TEX RESTAURANT SUPPLY, INC
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
daryl@atexrestaurantsupply.com

 

 

9FIFTEEN SOLUTIONS
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
michele.klumb@9fifteensolutions.com

 

 

A & A ELECTRIC COMPANY OF BEAUMONT, INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
gina@aaelectricbmt.com

 

 

BUILT FOR DREAMS, INC.
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
algregg@builtfordreams.com

 

 

MODULAR OFFICE AND DESKING
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
glen@natcube.com

 

 

MOVEWORKS, INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
marissa@move-works.com

 

 

SOUTH TEXAS LIGHTHOUSE FOR THE BLIND (South Texas Lighthouse for the Blind)
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
johnm@stlb.net

 

 

MCKINNEY OFFICE SUPPLY, INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
alexaw@mckinneyofficesupply.com

 

 

NPCI Holdings
Progress Intention Not Declared

 
sales@nationalpci.com

 

 

MCCOY-ROCKFORD, INC. DBA
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

mailto:kallen@skgtexas.com
mailto:daryl@atexrestaurantsupply.com
mailto:michele.klumb@9fifteensolutions.com
mailto:gina@aaelectricbmt.com
mailto:algregg@builtfordreams.com
mailto:glen@natcube.com
mailto:marissa@move-works.com
mailto:johnm@stlb.net
mailto:alexaw@mckinneyofficesupply.com
mailto:sales@nationalpci.com


 
jrademacher@rockford-texas.com

 

 

CVK ENTERPRISES, INC (Federal Supply USA)
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
bids@federalsupply.com

 

 

NMG WORKSPACE SOLUTIONS, LLC
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
jcornelius@nmg.us.com

 

 

PAUL E. SERNAU INC.
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
pes@paulesernau.com

 

 

BORDER TOBACCO dba Party Bowl Event Solutions
Progress No Bid

 
Alice@party-bowl.com

 

 

MIDWEST TECHNOLOGY PRODUCTS & SERVI (MIDWEST TECHNOLOGY PRODUCTS)
Progress No Bid

 
AKENNEDY@MIDWESTTECHNOLOGY.COM

 

 

DREAM RANCH, LLC (Dream Ranch Office Supplies)
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
sheri@dreamranchtx.com

 

 

MTS SEATING
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
kathyondrus@mtsseating.com

 

 

ONEPOINTE SOLUTIONS
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
jorozco@onepointesolutions.com

 

 

OFFICEWISE FURNITURE & SUPPLY
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
tsansom@officewiseco.com

 

 

OFFICE EQUIPMENT DIRECT
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

mailto:jrademacher@rockford-texas.com
mailto:bids@federalsupply.com
mailto:jcornelius@nmg.us.com
mailto:pes@paulesernau.com
mailto:Alice@party-bowl.com
mailto:AKENNEDY@MIDWESTTECHNOLOGY.COM
mailto:sheri@dreamranchtx.com
mailto:kathyondrus@mtsseating.com
mailto:jorozco@onepointesolutions.com
mailto:tsansom@officewiseco.com


 
clarabaumgarten@att.net

 

 

OFFICE FURNITURE INNOVATIONS, L.L.C.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
jedison@ofillc.com

 

 

Custom Packaging Pro
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
Support@custompackagingpro.com

 

 

A-TEX RESTAURANT SUPPLY INC
Progress Response In Progress

Daryl Cates
atexinfo@atexrestaurantsupply.com

 

 

AL'S FURNITURE LLC (Al's Furniture)
Progress Response In Progress

 
clintk7@aol.com

 

 

PATCO HARDWARE & LUMBER
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
sales@patcohardware.com

 

 

PALA SUPPLY COMPANY, INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
larry@schoolsupplypacks.com

 

 

GREER'S, INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
greerfabrics@sbcglobal.net

 

 

OFFICE DESIGN CONCEPTS CORP
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
joseph@odc-llc.com

 

 

OFFICE DEPOT
Progress Event Not Viewed

Not Available
stateoftexas@officedepot.com

 

 

GRACEFUL MOVES LLC
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

mailto:clarabaumgarten@att.net
mailto:jedison@ofillc.com
mailto:Support@custompackagingpro.com
mailto:atexinfo@atexrestaurantsupply.com
mailto:clintk7@aol.com
mailto:sales@patcohardware.com
mailto:larry@schoolsupplypacks.com
mailto:greerfabrics@sbcglobal.net
mailto:joseph@odc-llc.com
mailto:stateoftexas@officedepot.com


 
ggray@gracefulmovestx.com

 

 

RECREONICS, INC.
Progress Intention Not Declared

 
aquatics@recreonics.com

 

 

PKJ INTERNATIONAL LLC
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
SALES@PKJINTERNATIONAL.COM

 

 

JEAN'S RESTAURANT SUPPLY
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
bids@jeansrs.com

 

 

SOUTH CENTRAL SUPPLY LLC (South Central Supply LLC)
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
sales@supplytexas.com

 

 

EPICENTER PRODUCTIONS, LLC
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
zach@epicenterproductions.net

 

 

HOTEL ENGINE, LLC
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
Steve@hotelengine.com

 

 

LIBRARY DESIGN SYSTEMS INC
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
fbaucom@ldsgroupusa.com

 

 

LONGBOTHAM FURNITURE CO., INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
longbothamfurn@embarqmail.com

 

 

LIBERTY TECHNOLOGIES, INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
djb@libertytechusa.com

 

 

GOLDEN TRIANGLE MINORITY BUSINESS COUNCIL
Progress Event Not Viewed

mailto:ggray@gracefulmovestx.com
mailto:aquatics@recreonics.com
mailto:SALES@PKJINTERNATIONAL.COM
mailto:bids@jeansrs.com
mailto:sales@supplytexas.com
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Beverly Hatcher
hatcher.beverly@gtmbc.com

 

 

WORKPLACE RESOURCE (Workplace Resource, LLC)
Progress Intention Not Declared

Jennifer Cartlidge
jennifer.cartlidge@wrstx.com

 

 

LAIRD PLASTICS
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
ayarborough@lairdplastics.com

 

 

BAYTECH SUPPLY INC
Progress Event Not Viewed

CAROLE SEXTON
carole@baytechsupply.com

DAVID YABLONSKI
baytincorp@aol.com

 

KKH RENTALSINC DBA NATIONALSTRUCTURES
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
rickf@nationaltents.com

 

 

MATERIAL HANDLING SOLUTIONS
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
mathandling@sbcglobal.net

 

 

MARTIN'S OFFICE SUPPLY, INCORPORATED
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
bids3@mosdirect.com

 

 

MASON EQUITY GROUP LLC
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
info@masonequitygrp.com

 

 

SCHOOL SPECIALTY
Progress Submitted

Total Bid 435,791.70

Amy Fuss
bidnotices@schoolspecialty.com

 

 

MAKEHAUS LLC
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
mike@makehaus.com

 

 

MANNING'S OFFICE SOLUTIONS, L.L.C.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

mailto:hatcher.beverly@gtmbc.com
mailto:jennifer.cartlidge@wrstx.com
mailto:ayarborough@lairdplastics.com
mailto:carole@baytechsupply.com
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mailto:mike@makehaus.com


 
jimm@manningsupply.com

 

 

PENCIL CUP OFFICE PRODUCTS, INC.
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
tg@pencil-cup.com

 

 

STAT! UPHOLSTERY LIMITED LIABILITY
Progress Intention Not Declared

 
info@statuph.com

 

 

DEA SPECIALTIES CO., INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
awright@deaspecialties.com

 

 

Women's Business Council - Southwest (Women's Business Council Southwest)
Progress Event Not Viewed

Sade Atkinson
satkinson@wbcsouthwest.org

 

 

Aztec Events & Tents (Aztec Events & Tents)
Progress Intention Not Declared

Russell Roup
russ.roup@aztecusa.com

 

 

CREATIVE MATTRESS DESIGNS, LP DBA
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
verforster@csimex.net

 

 

DFW Minority Supplier Development Council
Progress Event Not Viewed

Edwin Cruz
sourcing@dfwmsdc.com

 

 

CREATIVE STYLE FURNITURE, INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
design@creativestylefurniture.com

 

 

CRAFT OFFICE SYSTEMS, INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
sales@craftofficesystems.com

 

 

CRAGG'S DO IT BEST LUMBER AND
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

mailto:jimm@manningsupply.com
mailto:tg@pencil-cup.com
mailto:info@statuph.com
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mailto:satkinson@wbcsouthwest.org
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CRAGGSDIB@GVTC.COM

 

 

EL SOL LOGISTICS, INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
billing@elsollogistics.com

 

 

Hertz Furniture Systems, LLC (Limited Liability Co.)
Progress Submitted

Total Bid 579,849.00

Mutty Leiser
mleiser@hertzfurniture.com

 

 

EVENFLO COMPANY INC
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
evenflosales@worldsafe.net

 

 

DESIGNS THAT COMPUTE, INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
susan@visionality.com

 

 

PASCO BROKERAGE, INC.
Progress Intention Not Declared

 
khollon@pascoinc.net

 

 

PARTY TIME RENTALS INC
Progress Response In Progress

Amanda Benavidez
sales@partytimerentals.com

 

 

EXPERT RELOCATION SYSTEMS, LLC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
Derrick.Ellison@ExpertRelo.com

 

 

ERIN MCCLELLAND MUSEUM SERVICES
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
erin@erinmcclelland.net

 

 

ARRIBA SCIENTIFIC INC
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
YCARROLL@ARRIBASCIENTIFIC.COM

 

 

ERGO EXPERIENTIAL LLC
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

mailto:CRAGGSDIB@GVTC.COM
mailto:billing@elsollogistics.com
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diana@ergoxp.com

 

 

AGARWOOD CONSTRUCTION & RESTORATION, LLC (ACR)
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
hn.acr.ltd@gmail.com

 

 

FRED CLARK FELT COMPANY
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
JOE.RAMIREZ@FREDCLARKCO.COM

 

 

FACILITY INTERIORS, INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
jest@fmgi.com

 

 

FORT WORTH BILLIARD SUPPLY CO
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
accounting@fortworthbilliards.com

 

 

LONGHORN OFFICE PRODUCTS INC
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
mswinkler@longhornop.com

 

 

SOUTHWEST CONTRACT
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
steve@swcontract.com

 

 

EL PASO OFFICE PRODUCTS, LLC
Progress Event Not Viewed

 
sgrodin@elpasoop.com

 

 

FACILITECH, INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
ssmith@businessinteriors.com

 

 

FACILITIES RESOURCE, INC.
Progress Invitation Unaccepted

 
mteinert@fri-texas.com
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**Please RUSH this project as these furniture for tents is needed ASAP** / Bid can only be on street 1 week / See 
Emergency Justification/E-mail attached / See attached bid specifications as well as suggested suppliers
 Added By Cherise Toler 7/31/2020 9:20 AM

 

AWARD INFORMATION:
This is a SPLIT award between Debner and Forms & Surfaces.  I am unable to issue an award in AggieBuy to 
Forms & Surfaces because I cannot designate them as a proxy supplier.  Partial award will be indicated in the bid 
module to Debner, the remainder is awarded to Forms and Surfaces.  Awarding to Forms and Surfaces via TXMAS 
Contract# TXMAS-20-7103  
See SmartBuy requisition# 1497634 PO# 20127638
 Added By Cherise Toler 8/13/2020 10:35 AM

 



Q&A Board
Subject = Color   (GL Seaman of Houston DBA Debner + Company) Private Thread
Q: If we can get black and white powder-coated tables 
and chairs here by the 17th will those be considered, or 
have you decided 100% silver only? Do the chairs 100% 
have to be metal? See attachment for some more 
options. We think the West Coast Industries chair is a 
good option but it does have some wood wenge instead 
of being all metal.

Question added by: Julia Harris 8/5/2020 3:57 PM CDT

 Outdoor Furniture Spec Sheets.pdf - ../Attachments/QABoardAttachments/Outdoor Furniture Spec Sheets.pdf
A: Hello, I would encourage you to respond with pricing 
on these, as long as they are durable and suitable for 
long-term outdoor use.

Answered by: Cherise Toler 8/5/2020 5:14 PM CDT

Q: Good Morning! See attached for more options 
including pricing and lead time. The Knoll is priced on 
OMNIA Texas contract and the Emeco can be priced on 
the E&I contract. Although the Global is not metal, it is 
an all-weather chair and the pricing is a great option to 
get the seating here NOW. Global is also priced on E&I. 
Looking forward to hearing back from you-- I will submit 
whichever pricing you prefer. West Coast Industries can 
get the most tables here ASAP but it is still only 300 of 
the 580.

Question added by: Julia Harris 8/6/2020 10:54 AM CDT

 Outdoor Furniture Spec Sheets 8.6.pdf - ../Attachments/QABoardAttachments/Outdoor Furniture Spec Sheets 
A: West coast might be best bet. Are there matching 
chairs? Answered by: Cherise Toler 8/6/2020 12:33 PM CDT

Q: See attachment for the options provided and number 
of chairs in stock now from West Coast. Personally I love
the Breeze chair but it does not come armless, so I was 
trying to fit that specification with the side chair. It is less 
expensive than the side chair with wenge wood backing 
and seat. The Picnic chair is also nice but more 
expensive than the first WCI chair proposed. 
https://westcoastindustries.com/product/breeze/

Question added by: Julia Harris 8/6/2020 12:39 PM CDT

 Texas A&M Chair Options - Chair options.pdf - ../Attachments/QABoardAttachments/Texas A&M Chair Options 
- Chair options.pdf

A: The end users are pretty firm on the silver color and 
desire a powder coat finish - so I would recommend 
bidding products that meet those specs, however, we 
also want to have options. Bidders are encouraged to 
submit multiple options with their bid response. This can 
be done by attaching documents in the "Supplier 
Attachments" section of the bid.

Answered by: Cherise Toler 8/6/2020 12:48 PM CDT

 

Subject = Shipping   (GL Seaman of Houston DBA Debner + Company) Private Thread
Q: 4. Can we have product shipped directly to campus 
and offload on the street then take wherever it needs to 
be installed?

Question added by: Julia Harris 8/5/2020 1:35 PM CDT

A: See answer to question #3 Answered by: Cherise Toler 8/5/2020 2:48 PM CDT

 

Subject = Placement of Furniture   (GL Seaman of Houston DBA Debner + Company) Private Thread
Q: Will the tables and chairs be outside 24/7 and can 
you please provide a campus map of where these tables
and chairs will be installed and spread out for installation
pricing?

Question added by: Julia Harris 8/5/2020 1:35 PM CDT

A: End users are now requesting vendor to quote 
delivery only to this address: 
Telecommunications-Receiving Warehouse 1501 Texas 
Ave. South College Station, TX 77840-1174 TAMU will 
handle the distribution throughout campus. Tables and 
chairs will be outdoors 24/7

Answered by: Cherise Toler 8/5/2020 2:46 PM CDT

Q: Do we need to provide a team to unload the truck at 
Texas A&M? Question added by: Julia Harris 8/6/2020 9:30 AM CDT

A: The truck will need to be unloaded, yes Answered by: Cherise Toler 8/6/2020 10:07 AM CDT

 



Subject = Use of Furniture   (GL Seaman of Houston DBA Debner + Company) Private Thread
Q: What is the use of this outdoor furniture? Classes? 
Cafeteria? Question added by: Julia Harris 8/5/2020 1:34 PM CDT

A: Outdoor Answered by: Cherise Toler 8/5/2020 2:47 PM CDT

 

Subject = Multiple Manufacturers   (GL Seaman of Houston DBA Debner + Company) Private Thread
Q: 1. Will different manufacturers be accepted, should 
we be able to get substantial amounts of seating or 
tables here in the fastest amount of time?

Question added by: Julia Harris 8/5/2020 1:34 PM CDT

A: TAMU prefers one manufacturer/model for 
consistency and aesthetics. May consider up to two 
types of tables/chairs.

Answered by: Cherise Toler 8/5/2020 2:47 PM CDT

 

Subject = Brand of Furniture   (Midwest Office Furniture Inc) Private Thread
Q: On the prerequisites, it states, No Substitutions on 
Brand Accepted - Must Match Existing. My question is. 
Where do we find the information on the brand to be 
specified?

Question added by: Richard Finn 7/31/2020 10:46 AM 
CDT

A: This language has been removed, thank you for 
bringing to my attention. Answered by: Cherise Toler 8/5/2020 2:48 PM CDT


