Event Summary - AV System Upgrade

Type Invitation to Bid Number 02-AMQTAR-ITB-2670
Organization TAMU Currency US Dollar
Event Status Awarded Work Group TAMU-Qatar
Exported on 2/24/2021 Exported by Cherise Toler
For Requisition 127143213 Created Document 141141709
Estimated Value 277,581.45 USD Payment Terms -
Bid and Evaluation
Respond by Proxy Allow Use Panel Questionnaire No
Sealed Bid Yes Auto Score No

Cost Analysis No
Alternate Items No

Visibility and Communication
Visible to Public Yes
Enter a short description for this public event

exas A&M University at Qatar is seeking bids to supply and install AV System Upgrade at three Texas A&M Qatar
Campus Lecture Halls. NOTE: This project requires installation and is located in QATAR.

Commodity Codes
None Added

Event Dates
Time Zone
Released

Open

Close

Sealed Until

Q&A Close

Event Users

Event Creator

Cherise Toler
CTOLER@TAMU.EDU
Phone +1 979-845-5887

Event Owners

Cherise Toler
CTOLER@TAMU.EDU

Phone +1 979-845-5887
Jim Nelms
JANELMS@TAMU.EDU
Phone +1 979-845-3819
Stephen Wolfe
SWOLFE3@TAMU.EDU
Phone +1 979-845-4570

CDT/CST - Central Standard Time (US/Central)

10/21/2020 12:00 AM CDT
12/10/2020 2:00 PM CST
12/10/2020 2:00 PM

+  Show Sealed Bid Open Date to Supplier

12/10/2020 2:00 PM CST

Patricia Winkler
P-WINKLER@TAMU.EDU

Phone
Angelita Constancio
AGC@TAMU.EDU
Phone
Cherise Toler
CTOLER@TAMU.EDU

Phone

+1 979-845-4556

+1 979-845-3847

+1 979-845-5887



Leann Harris
leann.harris@tamu.edu

Phone +1 979-845-2325
Susan King
SA-KING@TAMU.EDU

Phone +1 979-845-3888

Contacts

Cherise Toler
CTOLER@TAMU.EDU
Phone +1 979-845-5887

Stakeholders

Chidnand Harripersad

CHIDNAND.HARRIPERSAD@QATAR.TAMU.EDU

TAMU ORDERING DEPT 02-QENG

purchasing@gatar.tamu.edu
Phone +974 4423 0521

Paul Admin Barzak
p-barzak@tamu.edu

Phone +1 979-845-3816
Clyde Oberg
CO@TAMU.EDU

Phone +1 979-845-1042

Joren Muli
JOREN.MULI@QATAR.TAMU.EDU

Brandie Watson
B.WATSON@TAMU.EDU
Phone +1 979-845-8286




Description

Texas A&M University at Qatar is seeking bids to supply and install AV System Upgrade at Texas A&M Qatar
Campus Lecture Halls 143, 144 and 238.

Upon award, item will be for use and delivery to the Texas A&M University at Qatar campus located in Doha,
Qatar.

SITE VISIT:

**Site Visit will be scheduled maximum of one week before the bid closing date; Interested bidder needs to
contact purchasing(@gqatar.tamu.edu for the schedule of visit and proper entry procedure;

Due to Covid 19 restrictions, only one representative per company will be allowed to come during the site
visit.**

NOTE: Travel restrictions into the country (Qatar) are in place. It is recommended that vendors take note
of this and the requirement of the awarded vendor to perform installation of the products bid here-in on
the Texas A&M campus located in Doha, Qatar.

Attention Bidders:

Texas A&M, Procurement Services is transitioning to an E-commerce system for all invitation for bids and
purchase orders. We are asking all vendors to take a few moments and register as one of our vendors. This will
allow you to respond to our bid invitations electronically as well as view other bid opportunities.

Please visit the following website to register:
https://bids.sciquest.com/apps/Router/PublicEvent?CustomerOrg=TAMU

If you have any questions in reference to registrations, please contact us at 979-845-2325.
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All invitation for bid documents not submitted electronically via the AggieBid system will only be accepted via
the following methods:

-Email - tamuaggiebid@tamu.edu

-Express Mail (FedEx, UPS, etc.)

-US Postal Service

-Hand Delivered

All invitation for bid documents not submitted electronically via the AggieBid system must be returned on our
form.

As a bidder responding to this invitation upon submission of your response, regardless of the format of your
submission, you and the entity you represent are agreeing to the terms and conditions presented here as well as
the TAMU terms and conditions located

at http://purchasing.tamu.edu/media/123743/bidtamu.pdf

Physical Address:

Texas A&M University
Procurement Services
Agronomy Road

College Station TX 77843-1477
Fax - 979-845-3800



NOTE: If responding manually, please submit with your bid response a W9. This will allow us to enter your
company into our bid system and include your response on the electronic tabulation



Pl'e requ iSiteS k- Required to Enter Bid
1 * Instructions To Supplier :

Please acknowledge that the additional terms and conditions have been reviewed:

Certification

| certify that | have read and agree to the terms above.
Supplier Must Also Upload a File:

No

Prerequisite Content:



Warranty:
Bidders shall indicate warranty terms of product offered:

Award

In accordance with Texas Education Code 51.9335, Texas A&M University shall make the award based on, but not limited to,
the following best value criteria:

e The purchase price;

e The reputation of the vendor and of the vendor's goods or services;

e The quality of the vendor's goods or services;

¢ The extent to which the goods or services meet the institution's needs;

e The vendor's past relationship with the institution;

e The impact on the ability of the institution to comply with laws and rules relating to historically underutilized
businesses and to the procurement of goods and services from persons with disabilities;

e The total long-term cost to the institution of acquiring the vendor's goods or services;

¢ Any other relevant factor that a private business entity would consider in selecting a vendor; and

e The use of material in construction or repair to real property that is not proprietary to a single vendor unless
the institution provides written justification in the request for bids for use of the unique material specified.

e Conformance of vendor's VPAT with Texas A&M IT Accessibility guidelines

Other relevant factors deemed necessary to evaluate the offer and determine the best value for the University:

Vendor’s ability to meet the minimum specifications;

e Delivery requirement;

e Payment Terms offered,;

e Shipping Terms;

e Training offered;

¢ The quality, availability and adaptability of equipment offered to required application.
¢ Insurance Requirements

By submitting a bid in response to this solicitation, bidder agrees to the selection and award process, and accepts Texas A&M
University’s judgment and decision of award. Texas A&M reserves the right to accept or reject any or all bids, waive
informalities and technicalities, and accept the offer considered the most advantageous to the University. Texas A&M University
reserves the right to make the decision as to what system best meets the minimum specifications and which system best suits the
needs of the university. Texas A&M’s decision is final.



* Instructions To Supplier :

Acknowledge that you are able to meet the delivery requirements.

Certification

| certify that | have read and agree to the terms above.
Supplier Must Also Upload a File:

No

Prerequisite Content:



Upon award, item will be for use and delivery to the Texas A&M University at Qatar campus located in Doha,
Qatar. Awarded vendor will conduct installation of the products. Vendors must note that there are currently
travel restrictions in place, due to Covid-19, that may prevent travel into the country.



Buyer Attachments

Terms and Conditions
VPAT

Installation Terms and Conditions

Addendum
Addendum 2
Addendum 3

Fire sprinkler layout - 238
Main Lecture Hall - Ceiling Plan
Main Lecture Hall - Data-Voice

Main Lecture Hall - Elevations

Small Lecture Hall - Ceiling and Floor
Plans

Small Lecture Halls - Data & Voice
Small Lecture Halls - Elevations

Small power drawings

Addendum 4

Detailed Specifications - Updated
11.16.20.docx

Fire sprinkler layout - 238.dwg
Main Lecture Hall - Ceiling Plan.dwg
Main Lecture Hall - Data-Voice.dwg

Main Lecture Hall - Elevations.dwg
Small Lecture Hall - Ceiling and Floor
Plans.dwg

Small Lecture Halls - Data &
Voice.dwg

Small Lecture Halls - Elevations.dwg

Small power drawings.dwg

Addendum 5 - Due Date Extension
Addendum 6

REVISED Detailed Specifications -
Updated 11.24.2020

TAMU Standard Terms and
Conditions.pdf

VPAT2.4Rev508--February2020-1
.doc

Installation Terms and
Conditions.pdf

Addendum 1.pdf

Addendum 2.pdf

Addendum 3.pdf

Fire sprinkler layout - 238.pdf
Main Lecture Hall - Ceiling
Plan.pdf

Main Lecture Hall -
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Small Lecture Hall - Ceiling and
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Small Lecture Halls -
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Small power drawings.pdf
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Detailed Specifications - Updated
11.16.20.docx
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Main Lecture Hall -
Data-Voice.dwg

Main Lecture Hall -
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Small Lecture Halls - Data &
Voice.dwg
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Detailed Specifications - Updated
11.24.2020.docx

../Attachments/TAMU Standard
Terms and Conditions.pdf

../Attachments/VPAT2.4Rev508--Febr
uary2020-1.doc

../Attachments/Installation Terms and
Conditions.pdf

../Attachments/Addendum 1.pdf
../Attachments/Addendum 2.pdf
../Attachments/Addendum 3.pdf

../Attachments/Fire sprinkler layout -
238.pdf

../Attachments/Main Lecture Hall -
Ceiling Plan.pdf

../Attachments/Main Lecture Hall -
Data-Voice.pdf

../Attachments/Main Lecture Hall -
Elevations.pdf

../Attachments/Small Lecture Hall -
Ceiling and Floor Plans.pdf

../Attachments/Small Lecture Halls -
Data & Voice.pdf

../Attachments/Small Lecture Halls -
Elevations.pdf

../Attachments/Small power
drawings.pdf

../Attachments/Addendum 4.pdf

../Attachments/Detailed Specifications
- Updated 11.16.20.docx

../Attachments/Fire sprinkler layout -
238.dwg

../Attachments/Main Lecture Hall -
Ceiling Plan.dwg

../Attachments/Main Lecture Hall -
Data-Voice.dwg

../Attachments/Main Lecture Hall -
Elevations.dwg

../Attachments/Small Lecture Hall -
Ceiling and Floor Plans.dwg

../Attachments/Small Lecture Halls -
Data & Voice.dwg

../Attachments/Small Lecture Halls -
Elevations.dwg

../Attachments/Small power
drawings.dwg

../Attachments/Addendum 5.pdf
../Attachments/Addendum 6.pdf

../Attachments/Detailed Specifications
- Updated 11.24.2020.docx



QueStionS & Supplier Response Is Required

Page 1

Group 1

11 Delivery Terms: Quote delivery time, upon receipt of order *
Text (Multi-Line)

1.2 Additional Charges - Shall be outlined here in: any additional charges not specified in this *

: invitation for bid shall become the responsibility of the vendor.

Text (Multi-Line)

1.3 Educational Discount: Provide any or all applicable discounts on the items listed. *

Text (Multi-Line)

Alternate Submissions will be accepted for all items OTHER than Extron & Polycom brands
(see Detailed Specifications).
For items not specific to Polycom or Extron, Texas A&M University will consider "alternate
submissions" provided they meet or exceed the specifications of the equipment listed.

14 Alternate submissions shall include all manufacturer make and model information, as well as %
all literature and cut sheet as necessary. Texas A&M University reserves the right to
determine equality, and all TAMU decisions shall be final.

Vendor to indicate if quoting as specified, or if alternate brands are offered:
Text (Multi-Line)

15 Vendor Contact Information:
' Name, Phone and Email Address of the individual who will be servicing this account.

Text (Multi-Line)

VPAT:
New procedures in accordance with university, state and federal regulations regarding the
procurement of Electronic and Information Resources (EIRs) require Texas A&M to obtain a

1.6 Voluntary Product Accessibility Template (VPAT) for each item procured that meets the *
State of Texas’ definition of EIR. A blank VPAT has been attached to the "Buyer
Attachments" section of the bid for your convenience. See "Detailed Specifications" for more
information.

Text (Single Line)

1.7 Shipping Terms: Indicate incoterm offered - DAP, DPP, EXW, Etc. *
Text (Multi-Line)

1.8 Warranty Terms: Indicate warranty terms offered: *
Text (Multi-Line)

1.9 Currency: Indicate currency quoted. It is requested that Qatar vendors provide pricing in

Qatari Riyals. *
Text (Single Line)

1.10 Payment Terms: 100% Net 30 upon receipt of goods, invoice, completion of installation, *

: acceptance, whichever is later. Is the vendor agreed to these payment terms?

Text (Single Line)
Site Visit: **Site Visit will be scheduled a MAXIMUM of one week before the bid closing
date; Interested bidder needs to contact purchasing@gqatar.tamu.edu for the schedule of visit
and proper entry procedure;

1.1 Due to Covid 19 restrictions, only one representative per company will be allowed to come %

during the site visit.**

It shall be the vendors responsibility to make arrangements for the site visit. Site visits will
not be conducted in fewer than 7 days prior to the bid closing time.



Text (Single Line)

Vendor to acknowledge receipt of the attached document titled: "Addendum 1". Additionally,
"Addendum 2" was added 10.30.2020.

These documents contains site visit information. Site visit must be scheduled by November
2, 2020, 5:00 p.m. DOHA time.

Text (Single Line)

Addendum - ../Attachments/QuestionAttachments/Addendum 1.pdf

Vendor to acknowledge receipt of "Addendum 3." Additionally, PDF's of AutoCad drawings
have been added to the "Supplier Attachments" section of the bid.

Text (Single Line)

Vendor to acknowledge receipt of "Addendum 4" and "Detailed Specifications - Revised
11.16.20" - attached in the "Supplier Attachments" section of the bid.

Text (Single Line)

Acknowledge receipt of "Addendum 5" and "Addendum 6" as well as "Revised Detailed
Specifications - 11.24.20."

Text (Single Line)



PrOduct Llne Items *IRequired Product Line

tems

Group P1
Item Name, Commodity - Allow Requested
# Code, Description Qty. UoM Target Price Alternates Delivery

Blank Plate - Double
(Black)

45111600 - Projectors and supplies | 5752 <$500, 5787 <$5k, 8424 / Blank Plate - Double (Black)

One USB A Female to
One USB A Female on
P1.2 10"-Pigtail, One RJ-45 * 2 EA - Each - -
Female to Female
Barrel - Data (...

45111600 - Projectors and supplies | 5752 <$500, 5787 <$5k, 8424 / One USB A Female to One USB A
Female on 10"+Pigtail, One RJ-45 Female to Female Barrel - Data (Black)

P1.1 *x 2 EA - Each - -

COLOR DLP
PROJECTOR with

P1.3 ULTRA SHORT * 4 EA - Each - -
THROWLENS
45111600 - Projectors and supplies | 5752 <$500, 5787 <$5k, 8424 / COLOR DLP PROJECTOR with
ULTRA SHORT THROWLENS

P1.4  Projector Mount * 4 EA - Each - -
45111600 - Projectors and supplies | 5752 <$500, 5787 <$5k, 8424 / Projector Mount
Projection Screen,
Motorized, 123", 16:10,

P1.5 Image Area165x264cm 4 EA - Each ) )
45111600 - Projectors and supplies | 5752 <$500, 5787 <$5k, 8424 / Projection Screen, Motorized, 123",
16:10, Image Area165x264cm

P1.6  Low Voltage Controller « 4 EA - Each - -
45111600 - Projectors and supplies | 5752 <$500, 5787 <$5k, 8424 / Low Voltage Controller
12" Wall Mount
TouchLink Pro

P17 Touchpanel with HOMI * * EA - Bach - -
andXTP Input
45111600 - Projectors and supplies | 5752 <$500, 5787 <$5k, 8424 / 12" Wall Mount TouchLink Pro
Touchpanel with HDMI andXTP Input
POWER INJECTOR

P1.8 FOR THE TLP PRO * 1 EA - Each - -
1220MG
45111600 - Projectors and supplies | 5752 <$500, 5787 <$5k, 8424 / POWER INJECTOR FOR THE TLP
PRO 1220MG
Gooseneck

P1.9  microphone for Podium « 2 EA - Each - -

52161520 - Microphones | 5760 <$5k, 8424 /| Gooseneck microphone for Podium

Ceiling Mount and

P1.10 Speaker - As Per

) Attached Detailed
Specifications

43191610 - Personal communication holders or mounts, stands | 5770 <$5k, 8445 / Replace existing ceiling
mount speakers and grills with another speaker system for voice lift. The new solution is expected to
provide better voice quality throughout the room. Current model is JBL Professional Control 26-DT. Existing
cutouts are 20 cm in diameter. Back speaker depth is 23 cm. Speaker grill is round with a diameter of 32
cm. The new speakers should be optimized to work with the amplifier selection in 15.

* 22 EA - Each - -

Brand: Any branded model

Wireless Microphone
P1.11 System, handheld *x 4 EA - Each - -

52161551 - Wireless microphone and instrument amplification system | 5752 <$500, 5780 <$5k, 8424 /
Wireless Microphone System, handheld



P1.12

P1.13

P1.14

P1.15

P1.16

P1.17

P1.18

P1.19

P1.20

P1.21

P1.22

P1.23

Wireless Microphone
System, lapel *x 4 EA - Each

52161551 - Wireless microphone and instrument amplification system | 5752 <$500, 5780 <$5k, 8424 /
Wireless Microphone System, lapel

Antenna Distribution
System

52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / Antenna Distribution System

UHF Wide-band
Directional LPDA * 1 EA - Each - -
Antennas

52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / UHF Wide-band Directional LPDA
Antennas

*x 2 EA - Each - -

Extron Amplifier

optimized to support

the speakers selection * 2 EA - Each - -
listed in item #10.

Brand: Extron

52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / Extron Amplifier optimized to
support the speakers selection listed in item #10.

Brand: Extron

FLush Mounted
Speakers

52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / Flush mounted in-wall speakers to
replace existing speakers. These speakers are used for PC audio, video conferencing, and, in general,
program audio. The new solution is expected to produce better audio quality in the room. Currently, the
model installed in 143 and 144 is Tannoy IW6DS (2 speakers per hall) with approximate dimensions of 270
mm x 170 mm, depth of 10-14 cm. The new speakers should be compatible to work with the built-in
amplifier in the Extron switcher selection in 17.

*x 2 EA - Each - -

Brand: Any branded model

10x8 Seamless 4K

Scaling Presentation

Matrix Switcher **With * 2 EA - Each - -
amplifier and control

processor

52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / Extron 10x8 Seamless 4K Scaling
Presentation Matrix Switcher with Amplifier and control processor. The speaker selection in 16 should take
into account that the switcher Amplifier will be used to drive the speakers.

Brand: Extron
Ceiling Visualizer * 2 EA - Each - -
52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / Ceiling Visualizer

HDMI and Audio to
USB Scaling Bridge

52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / HDMI and Audio to USB Scaling
Bridge

PTZ Camera with Full
HD, HDMI, 30x Optical * 2 EA - Each - -
Zoom

52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / PTZ Camera with Full HD, HDMI,
30x Optical Zoom

* 2 EA - Each - -

Three Input

Multi-Format Switcher

with Integrated * 2 EA - Each - -
DTPTransmitter and

Audio Embedding

52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / Three Input Multi-Format Switcher
with Integrated DTPTransmitter and Audio Embedding

DTP Transmitter for *
HDMI

52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / DTP Transmitter for HDMI

DTP Receiver for
HDMI * 4 EA - Each - -

4 EA - Each - -



P1.24

P1.25

P1.26

P1.27

P1.28

P1.29

P1.30

P1.31

P1.32

P1.33

P1.34

P1.35

P1.36

52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / DTP Receiver for HDMI

7" Cable Cubby

TouchLink Pro

Touchpanel with

Cable Access * 2 EA - Each - -
Enclosure for AV

Connectivity, Remote

52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / 7" Cable Cubby TouchLink Pro
Touchpanel with Cable Access Enclosure for AV Connectivity, Remote Control, and 2 x AC Power, 1xHDMI
& 1xNetwork Rectractor andBlank Plates

Voltage Regulator * 4 EA - Each - -
39121635 - Voltage regulator | 4075 / Voltage Regulator

48" Presenter’s

Podium * 1 EA - Each - -

45111810 - Visual presenters | 5752 <$5k, 8424 | 48" Presenter’'s Podium

Cables, Connectors &
Misc. Hardware

26121600 - Electrical cable and accessories | 4075 / Cables, Connectors & Misc. Hardware

* 2 EA - Each - -

Installation, Testing,

Commissioning,

Project *x 2 EA - Each - -
Managementand

Programming Charges

99900294 - Other Contracted Services - no specific comm code available | 5670 / Installation, Testing,
Commissioning, Project Managementand Programming Charges

Blank Plate - Double
(Black)

45111600 - Projectors and supplies | 5752 <$500, 5787 <$5k, 8424 / Blank Plate - Double (Black)

One USB A Female to

One USB A Female on

10"-Pigtail, One RJ-45 x 1 EA - Each - -
Female to Female

Barrel - Data (...

52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / One USB A Female to One USB
A Female on 10"+Pigtail, One RJ-45 Female to Female Barrel - Data (Black)

COLOR DLP
PROJECTOR with *
ULTRA SHORT
THROWLENS

52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / COLOR DLP PROJECTOR with
ULTRA SHORT THROWLENS

Projector Mount * 1 EA - Each - -
45111600 - Projectors and supplies | 5752 <$500, 5787 <$5k, 8424 / Projector Mount

Projection Screen, Matt

White, Motorized,

189"/480 cm,16:10, * 1 EA - Each - -
Image Area 254 x 406

cm

45111600 - Projectors and supplies | 5752 <$500, 5787 <$5k, 8424 / Projection Screen, Matt White,
Motorized, 189"/480 cm,16:10, Image Area 254 x 406 cm

* 1 EA - Each - -

2 EA - Each - -

Low Voltage Controller * 1 EA - Each - -
39121635 - Voltage regulator | 4075 / Low Voltage Controller
12" Wall Mount

TouchLink Pro *
Touchpanel with HDMI
andXTP Input

45111600 - Projectors and supplies | 5752 <$500, 5787 <$5k, 8424 / 12" Wall Mount TouchLink Pro
Touchpanel with HDMI andXTP Input

POWER INJECTOR
FOR THE TLP PRO * 1 EA - Each - -
1220MG

1 EA - Each - -



P1.37

P1.38

P1.39

P1.40

P1.41

P1.42

P1.43

P1.44

P1.45

P1.46

P1.47

P1.48

45111600 - Projectors and supplies | 5752 <$500, 5787 <$5k, 8424 / POWER INJECTOR FOR THE TLP
PRO 1220MG

Gooseneck
microphone for Podium * 1 EA - Each - -

52161520 - Microphones | 5760 <$5k, 8424 /| Gooseneck microphone for Podium

GreessMioropho™® x4 EA-Each
52161520 - Microphones | 5760 <$5k, 8424 / Wireless Microphone System, handheld
Wireless Microphone
System, lapel

52161520 - Microphones | 5760 <$5k, 8424 / Wireless Microphone System, lapel

Antenna Distribution
System * 2 EA - Each - -

52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / Antenna Distribution System

UHF Wide-band
Directional LPDA * 1 EA - Each - -
Antennas

52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / UHF Wide-band Directional LPDA
Antennas

* 4 EA - Each - -

Extron Amplifier

optimized to support i ) _
the speakers selection * 2 EA - Each

in 44 Brand: Extron

52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / Extron Amplifier optimized to
support the speakers selection in 44
Brand: Extron

Flush mounted in-wall
speakers * 2 EA - Each - -

52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / Flush mounted in-wall speakers to
replace existing speakers. These speakers are used for PC audio, video conferencing, and, in general,
program audio. The new solution is expected to produce better audio quality for the room. The current
model is Tannoy IW6DS (2 speakers). The new speakers should be compatible to work with the built-in
amplifier in the Extron switcher selection in 45.

Brand: Any branded model

Ceiling Mount
Speakers

52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / Replace existing ceiling mount
speakers and grills with another speaker system for voice lift. The new solution is expected to provide better
voice quality throughout the room. Current model is JBL Professional Control 26-DT. The new speakers
should be optimized to work with the amplifier selection in 42.

* 19 EA - Each - -

Brand: Any branded model

10x8 Seamless 4K
Scaling Presentation & 2 EA - Each - -
Matrix Switcher

52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / Extron 10x8 Seamless 4K Scaling
Presentation Matrix Switcher with Amplifier and control processor. The speaker selection in 43 should take
into account that the switcher Amplifier will be used to drive the speakers.

Brand: Extron
Ceiling Visualizer * 1 EA - Each - -
52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / Ceiling Visualizer

HDMI and Audio to
USB Scaling Bridge

52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / HDMI and Audio to USB Scaling
Bridge

PTZ Camera with Full
HD, HDMI, 30x Optical * 3 EA - Each - -
Zoom

52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / PTZ Camera with Full HD, HDMI,
30x Optical Zoom

* 1 EA - Each - -



P1.49

P1.50

RealPresence Group
500-720p: Group 500
HD codec,
EagleEyelV-12x
camera, mic array,
univ. remote, ...

52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / RealPresence Group 500-720p:
Group 500 HD codec, EagleEyelV-12x camera, mic array, univ. remote, NTSC/PAL. Cables: 2 HDMI 1.8m,
1 CAT 5E LAN 3.6m, 1HDCI digital 3m, Power: UK-Type G, BS 1363.

Premier, One Year,
RealPresence Group
500-720p: Group500
HD codec,
EagleEyelV-12x
camera

45121500 - Cameras | 5752 <$500, 5781 <$5k, 8424 / Premier, One Year, RealPresence Group 500-720p:
Group500 HD codec, EagleEyelV-12x camera

* 1 EA - Each - -

* 1 EA - Each - -



Group Series 1080p
HD License-1080
P1.51 encode/decode for * 1 EA - Each - -
people & content. Valid
for Group 300, 500, ...

52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / Group Series 1080p HD
License-1080 encode/decode for people & content. Valid for Group 300, 500, 550, 700

Mounting bracket for
RealPresence Group
300 & 500. Allows

P1.52 EagleEye camera and * 1 EA - Each ) )
codec to be mounted...
43191610 - Personal communication holders or mounts, stands | 5770 <$5k, 8445 / Mounting bracket for
RealPresence Group 300 & 500. Allows EagleEye camera and codec to be mounted together.
Recommends use of 2215-68675-001 mountingbracket for wall/display mounting.
Universal Camera
Mounting for
EagleEyelV-12x&4x.

P1.53 Mounts on the * 1 EA - Each - -
wall/other flat surfaces
over 6.5i...
43191610 - Personal communication holders or mounts, stands | 5770 <$5k, 8445 / Universal Camera
Mounting for EagleEyelV-12x&4x. Mounts on the wall/other flat surfaces over 6.5in deep or flat screen
displays greater than 5/8in thick. Includes tripod mount. Also supports EagleEye Director, EagleEye
HD,EagleEye lll, EagleEye View.
Three Input
Multi-Format Switcher

P1.54 with Integrated * 1 EA - Each - -
DTPTransmitter and
Audio Embedding
52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / Three Input Multi-Format Switcher
with Integrated DTPTransmitter and Audio Embedding
DTP Transmitter for

P1.55 HDMI * 4 EA - Each - -

52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / DTP Transmitter for HDMI

DTP Receiver for
P1.56 HDMI *

52161500 - Audio and visual equipment | 5752 <$500, 5782 <$5k, 8424 / DTP Receiver for HDMI

7" Cable Cubby
TouchLink Pro
Touchpanel with
P1.57 Cable Access * 1 EA - Each - -
Enclosure for AV
Connectivity, Remote

4 EA - Each - -

26121600 - Electrical cable and accessories | 4075 / 7" Cable Cubby TouchLink Pro Touchpanel with
Cable Access Enclosure for AV Connectivity, Remote Control, and 2 x AC Power, 1xHDMI & 1xNetwork
Rectractor andBlank Plates

P1.58 XLR Wall Plate * 2 EA - Each - -
45111600 - Projectors and supplies | 5752 <$500, 5787 <$5k, 8424 / XLR Wall Plate

P1.59 Voltage Regulator * 2 EA - Each - -
39121635 - Voltage regulator | 4075 / Voltage Regulator
48" Presenter’s

P1.60 Podium * 1 EA - Each - -
45111810 - Visual presenters | 5752 <$5k, 8424 / 48" Presenter’'s Podium

p161 Cables, Connectors& 4 EA - Each } )

Misc. Hardware
26121600 - Electrical cable and accessories | 4075 / Cables, Connectors & Misc. Hardware

Installation, Testing,
Commissioning,
P1.62 Project * 1 EA - Each - -
Managementand
Programming Charges



99900294 - Other Contracted Services - no specific comm code available | 5670 / Installation, Testing,
Commissioning, Project Managementand Programming Charges

Scissor projector lift for
238. The lift model will
P1.63 depend on the * 1 EA - Each - -
projector proposed by
the vendor.

Requirements: The lift must be from a branded manufacturer like draper and have the capability to travel
from the ceiling all the way down to about 1 m from the floor.

Extron EBP 110
D(60-1190-01) eBUS
P1.64 Button Panel with 10 * 6 EA - Each - -
Buttons-Decorator-Styl
e, White.

Extron Dual
Button-Custom Buttons
P1.65 for the Button Panel * 6 EA - Each - -
(Dual button-5 Nos). 6
units.

Shipping to DOHA,
P1.66 QATAR * 1 LO - Lot - -



Service Line Iltems
There are no ltems added to this event.



Price Components
There are no Price Components added to this event.



Suppliers
32 DEGREE TEC., INC.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

deborah@32degreeaudio.com

Hispanic Contractors Association de San Antonio

Progress Event Not Viewed

HCA Admin
admin@hcadesa.org

El Paso Hispanic Chamber of Commerce

Progress Event Not Viewed

Terri Reed
treed@ephcc.org

ACE OFFICE SUPPLIES

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

brkamani@aceofficesupply.com

ACE AUDIO COMMUNICATIONS, INC.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

lori@aceaudiocom.com

SPECTRUM PAPER CO., INC.

Progress Event Not Viewed

maxine@spectrumpaper.com

ABLES-LAND, INC.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

julie@ablesland.com

ADVANCED CONNECTIONS INC

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

markb@acicabling.com

ACP DIRECT

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

bids@acpdirect.com

NOLANS OFFICE PRODUCTS INC.

Progress Event Not Viewed

mark@nolansonline.com




ALARDIN DEVELOPMENT CORPORATION

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

tony@alardin.com

Vintage King Audio,Inc (Vintage King Audio)

Progress Intention Not Declared

Greg Fraser
greg.fraser@vintageking.com

Tri-County Regional Black Chamber of Commerce (Tri-County Regional Black Chamber of Commerce)

Progress Event Not Viewed

Leondria Thompson
procurement@tcbcc.org

IN DEPTH EVENTS, INC.

Progress Event Not Viewed

robert@indepth.events

RFx Analyst

Progress Intention Not Declared

Kelly Johnson
rfp@rfxanalyst.com

ASEL ART SUPPLY INC (Asel Art Supply)

Progress Event Not Viewed

tcicherski@aselart.com

ONC National (ONC National)

Progress Intention Not Declared
Jacquelyn Clayborn Stuart COURTNEY
onc@oncnational.com stuart.courtney@oncnational.com

FIRETROL PROTECTION SYSTEMS INC (Firetrol)

Progress Event Not Viewed

Jamie Comstock
jcomstock@firetrol.net

TECHNO Q

Progress Awarded

Total Bid 949,122.00
Total Awarded 949,122.00 USD

khaled.alamoodi@technog.com

HOUSTON MINORITY SUPPLIER DEVELOPMENT COUNCIL

Progress Event Not Viewed

Angela Freeman
angela.freeman@hmsdc.org




OMEGA BROADCAST & CINEMA, LP

Progress Event Not Viewed

pfry@omegabroadcast.com

AMERICAS COMPUTER COMPANY

Progress Event Not Viewed

aid@thealamo.net

KST DATA INC.

Progress Event Not Viewed

medson@kstdata.com

Intelisystems Group

Progress Response In Progress

IntelisystemsGroup@gmail.com

Y & S Technologies

Progress Event Not Viewed

Mordy Finck
mordy@yandstech.com

Southwest Minority Supplier Development Council

Progress Event Not Viewed

Noelle Flowers
noelle@smsdc.org

PRECISION BUSINESS MACHINES, INC.

Progress Event Not Viewed

rmassey@pbminc.com

CAN-AM WIRELESS, LLC

Progress Event Not Viewed

jrahardjo@canamwireless.com

ADVANTAGE SUPPLY

Progress Event Not Viewed

deals@advantagesupply.us

Consolidated Gulf Company

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

ovidiu@cgulfc.com



APPLIED NETWORK SECURITY L.L.C.

Progress Event Not Viewed

syamthe@appliednetworksecurity.com

808 TECHNOLOGIES,LLC (808 Technologies)

Progress Intention Not Declared

paul@808tech.net

C.D.&E. TECH SOLUTIONS LLC

Progress Event Not Viewed

sales@cdetechsolutions.com

PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS)

Progress Event Not Viewed

bids@pyramidsp.com

WERD MEDIA LABS, LLC (The Werd Company)

Progress Event Not Viewed

rfp@thewerd.co

Arkitektura Development Inc

Progress Event Not Viewed

Phillip Contreras
condg1@yahoo.com

Texas Association of African American Chamber of Commerce (TAAACC)

Progress Event Not Viewed

Charles O'Neal
info @TAAACC.org

M2 TECHNOLOGY INC

Progress Event Not Viewed

sue.mcelyea@m?2ti.com

ONEVISION SOLUTIONS (OneVision Solutions)

Progress Event Not Viewed

nciora@onevisionsolutions.com

ITECH ENTERPRISES LLC

Progress Event Not Viewed

eaguirre@itechavs.com

FULL COMPASS SYSTEMS LIMITED (Full Compass Systems Ltd)



Progress Event Not Viewed

supplierreg@fullcompass.com

DATAVOX

Progress Event Not Viewed

neil@datavox.net

ONE DIVERSIFIED, LLC (Diversified LLC)

Progress Event Not Viewed

mdichirico@diversifiedus.com

PDG INDUSTRIES, LLC (Alamo Classroom Solutions)

Progress Event Not Viewed

mguzman@alamocrsolutions.com

PROCOMPUTING CORP (ProComputing Services)

Progress Event Not Viewed

mckinstry@procomputing.com

NEXUS SMART SYSTEMS
Progress Submitted
Total Bid 339,487.69

Venkatesh Baskaran
vbaskaran@nexus-gatar.com

RSI GLOBAL COMMUNICATIONS GROUP, LLC

Progress Event Not Viewed

ron.crockett@rsigcg.com

Genesis Integration

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

jikku.john@genesis-si.com

Gulf Business Machines

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

gatar@gbmme.com

LIMITLESS OFFICE PRODUCTS (Limitless Office Products)

Progress Event Not Viewed

mg@limitlessofficeproducts.com

Panoutron Trading & Contracting WLL (Panoutron)



Progress Submitted
Total Bid 1,191,320.00

r.younis@panoutron.com

VIEWTECH GROUP, LLC (ViewTech)

Progress Intention Not Declared

miki.clement@yviewtechgroup.com

IDM PRODUCTS, LLC

Progress Event Not Viewed

gerald@idmproducts.com

BAYTECH SUPPLY INC

Progress Event Not Viewed

baytincorp@aol.com

CCS PRESENTATION SYSTEMS
Progress No Bid

bpickrel@ccsprojects.com

AvinED Technical Furnishings, Inc.

Progress Intention Not Declared

Brian Wagner
BWAGNER@AVINED.COM

ALMOE AV SOLUTIONS (ALMOE QATAR)

Progress Event Not Viewed

Sales Sales
abid@almoe.com

AISYS CONSULTING, LLC

Progress Event Not Viewed

elopez@aisysconsulting.com

Ford Audio Video Systems, LLC

Progress Intention Not Declared
Scott Hall
dalbid@fordav.com

ADVENT SYSTEMS INC

Progress Event Not Viewed

tim@soundtechs.com

Howard Industries Inc (Howard Technolog) (Howard Technology Solutions)



Progress Intention Not Declared

Rebecca Dearman
bids@howardcomputers.com

SCHOOL OUTFITTERS

Progress Event Not Viewed

contracts@schooloutfitters.com

ESP OF TEXAS (ENTERTAINMENT SYSTEM PRODU

Progress Event Not Viewed

m.utzman@espoftexas.com

BIWAY INTERNATIONAL TECHNOLOGY, INC.

Progress Event Not Viewed

josephwwang@gmail.com

HSS AUDIO VISUAL (HSS Audio Visual)

Progress Intention Not Declared

billin hssav.com

CX2, INC. (CX2, Inc.)

Progress No Bid
Jon Scanlon
claudem@cx2us.com jon@cx2us.com

WORK INNOVATORS LLC (Work Innovators LLC)

Progress Intention Not Declared

Agharese Aihie
ese.aihie@workinnovators.com

DEWITT POTH & SON

Progress Event Not Viewed

sales@dewittpoth.com

Texas Association of Mexican American Chamber of Commerce (TAMACC)

Progress Event Not Viewed

Pauline Anton
panton@TAMACC.org

WESTBANK GALLERY ART SERVICES

Progress Event Not Viewed

pamelajinteriors2@gmail.com

SIMBA INDUSTRIES

Progress Event Not Viewed



sales@simbaindustries.com

MANNAI TRADING CO WLL (Mannai Trading Company)

Progress Submitted
Total Bid 324,090.26
Sales Sales
vish@mannai.com.ga info@mannai.com.qa

DATA PROJECTIONS, INC.

Progress Response In Progress

rturner@dataprojections.com

GOVCONNECTION, INC. (Connection Public Sector Solutions)

Progress Event Not Viewed

sledcontracts@connection.com

Affinnitti Business Solutions, Inc.

Progress Intention Not Declared

Haider Niazi
haiderniazi@affinnitti.com

CLARY BUSINESS MACHINES SUFIAN MUNIR INC DBA

Progress Intention Not Declared

Omair Syed

omair@clarybusinessmachines.com

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEMS INC (AVES Audio Visual Systems, Inc.)

Progress Intention Not Declared

Russell Robbins
sales@avesav.com

Asian Contractor Association

Progress Event Not Viewed

Aletta Sung
asiancontractor@gmail.com

TITUS SYSTEMS, LP

Progress Event Not Viewed

Shelly@TeamTitus.com

ConstructConnect

Progress Intention Not Declared

Caitlin Kloppenburg
content@constructconnect.com

Regional Hispanic Contractors Association (RHCA)

Progress Event Not Viewed



Julio Florez
julio@regionalhca.org

Sandia International, Inc.

Progress Intention Not Declared

Alexander Ayanru
alex@sandiainternational.com

ALPHONSO SOLOMON AND COMPANY, INC.

Progress Event Not Viewed

asolomon@ascmgtconsultants.com

US Pan Asian American Chamber of Commerce SW (None)

Progress Event Not Viewed

Grace McDermott
gmcdermott@uspaacc-sw.org

NAVETECH SOLUTIONS, LLC (NaveTech Solutions, LLC)

Progress Event Not Viewed

amerri@navetechsolutions.com

HALL COMPANY FIVE, LLC DBA JODAC

Progress Event Not Viewed

timberly@jodac.com

ZACHRIS, INC.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

swpkg@charter.net

SOUTHERN SOUND SYSTEM INC
Progress No Bid

Kenny King
kenny@southernsoundsys.com

SEQUOYAH COMMUNICATION SOLUTIONS, LLC

Progress Event Not Viewed

tammy.grimm@sequoyahcom.com

Education Management Solutions (EMS)

Progress Event Not Viewed

rfpnotification@simulationig.com

TEJAS OFFICE SUPPLY

Progress Invitation Unaccepted



tejasofficesupply@stx.rr.com

SOUTHERN COMPUTER WAREHOUSE INC

Progress Event Not Viewed

scwbids@scw.com

TECHNOLOGY FOR EDUCATION, L.L.C.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

teri.anderson@tfeconnect.com

TRIDENT DIGITAL TECHNOLOGIES LLC

Progress Response In Progress

scobb@tridentdt.com

TECHCENTER DESIGN, INC.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

loretta@techcenterdesign.com

Redman Communications Inc.

Progress Intention Not Declared

mikejr@redmancomm.com

TAURUS TECHNOLOGIES INC

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

SALES@taurustechinc.com

THE PERSONAL COMPUTER STORE,

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

info@avinext.com

Trinity SLV

Progress Intention Not Declared

BIDS@TRINITYSLV.COM

TRINITY SYSTEM INTEGRATIONS COMPANY

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

phelms@trinity-services.net

WALA PRODUCTIONS, INC. DBA MOYERS GROUP

Progress Invitation Unaccepted



latronda@moyersgroup.com

ROCKY DURON & ASSOCIATES, INC.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

msduron@rockyduron.com

RIGHTSTAFF, INC.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

samason@rightstaffinc.com

SHI GOVERNMENT SOLUTIONS, INC

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

Texas@SHI.com

North America Procurement Council, Inc. PBC

Progress Response In Progress

Lyra de Asis

lyra@napc.me

SAN ANTONIO SOUND & LIGHT

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

joey@saslonline.com

SPECIALTY OPTICAL SYSTEMS, INC.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

brenda.mckenzie.cpa@gmail.com

SUPERIOR FIBER & DATA SERVICES, INC.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

cfuller@sfdcabling.com

VIA TECHNOLOGY, LLC
Progress No Bid

info@800viatech.com

SUN CITY CABLING, LLC

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

kerry@suncitycabling.com

TEXAS FURNITURE SOURCE, INC.

Progress Event Not Viewed



vptexasfurniture@sbcglobal.net

NORTHPOINT Il TECHNOLOGIES DBA A&M ELECT

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

hectorm@anmelectronics.com

PATRIA OFFICE SUPPLY

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

Ipatria123@yahoo.com

PATHWAY COMMUNICATIONS, LTD.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

haroldd@pcomus.com

PRECISION CAMERA & VIDEO

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

michaelpaul@precision-camera.com

PIRAINO CONSULTING, INC

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

james@pirainoconsulting.com

PROSOUND, INC.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

drcav@swbell.net

Test

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

ctoler@tamu.edu

PROCOMPUTING SERVICES, INC.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

cherri@procomputing.com

KP EVOLUTIONS LLC

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

mchavanne@kpevo.com

KINGDOM PROTECTION SERVICES, LLC

Progress Invitation Unaccepted



mancira@cwstx.com

KHT ELECTRONICS

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

Tabetha@khtwaco.com

MAESTRO INTEGRATIONS LLC

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

john@gotomaestro.com

LIBERTY TECHNOLOGIES, INC.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

dib@libertytechusa.com

SIGNAL PERFECTION LTD (AVI-SPL)

Progress Submitted
Total Bid 301,239.40
Mike Lopez

mike.lopez@avispl.com

MECHDYNE CORPORATION

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

chad.kickbush@mechdyne.com

NEW BEGINNINGS CAPITAL PARTNERSHIP, LLC

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

kermit@nbcpsourcing.com

NETWORK CABLING SERVICES, INC.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

sales@ncs-tx.com

NEAR FUTURE, LLC

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

twins@nearfuture.biz

HIGHPOINT TECHNOLOGY GROUP, LLC

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

steve.quistwite@gohighpoint.net

COVENANT COMMUNICATIONS CORP

Progress Event Not Viewed



kyle@covcom.com

H11 PRODUCTION CO.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

h11productionco@gmail.com

IVCI LLC (IVCi)
Progress No Bid

salesadministration@ivci.com

H B ELECTRONICS, INC.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

dalila@hbprosound.com

IMAGERY GRAPHICS SYSTEMS INC

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

sskaggs1234@aol.com

1-2- TECHNOLOGIES, LC

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

charmon@i2itech.com

Hi-Tech Bangla Information Systems, Inc.

Progress Intention Not Declared

Harun Khan
sales@htb-is.com

INTEGRATED TECHNOLOGY AND SECURITY

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

eharris@itandslic.com

INTEGRA SHOW SERVICES, INC.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

BOBBYFLEW@integrashow.com

Knight Security Systems

Progress Intention Not Declared

Jessica Vasquez
jvasquez@knightsecurity.com

XYPLES, LLC

Progress Event Not Viewed



tokonkwor@xyples.com

Dash Electricals Trading Contracting and Services

Progress Response In Progress

Nabeel Shafi
info@dashelectricals.com

INTELLIGENT INTEGRATED SYSTEMS LLC

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

cmiranda@intelli-systemstech.com

DURON BUILDING SPECIALITIES, LLC

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

sduron@duronbuildingspecialties.com

Space Age Laminating & Bindery
Progress Event Not Viewed

April Day

bids@wbea-texas.org

DIGITAL DISPLAY SOLUTIONS, INC.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

Iharbert@ddsav.com

EP TECHWORKS LLC

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

dbrahs@ep-techworks.com

MEDIA SUPPORT GROUP

Progress Intention Not Declared

kimberly@mediasupportgroup.net

ELECTRA LINK INC

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

houstonbids@electralink.com

FOCUSED TECHNOLOGY

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

dswain@focusedtechnology.com

GENERAL SOUND

Progress Invitation Unaccepted



gensound@gensound.com

Tech skill contracting and trading W.L.L

Progress Event Not Viewed

Ben Johnson
ben@tscqatar.com

G. THORNHILL, INC.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

dthornhill@sbstx.net

CHECKPOINT SERVICES, INC.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

kristen.cox@checkpnt.com

CPI IMAGING (CPI)

Progress Event Not Viewed

lisa.burchfield@accesseforms.com

CENTRAL TECHNOLOGIES INC

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

todd@centralinc.com

FIVE STAR TECH LTD. CO.

Progress Event Not Viewed

kgreiner@fivestartechltd.com

CDW GOVERNMENT LLC

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

petmcge@cdwg.com

COMMUNICATION CONCEPTS (Communication Concepts)

Progress Event Not Viewed

info@coconcepts.com

COMMERCIAL SALES & SERVICE INC

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

mike.redding@csstv.com

Amisa Trading Contracting and Services WLL
Progress Submitted
Total Bid 373,486.00



Mohammad Sultan
info@amisaqgatar.com

COMMERCIAL & INDUSTRIAL ELECTRONICS

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

mike@cietexas.com

D TRONICS, LTD.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

sdiaz@hedtronics.com

G-IT GOING LLC

Progress Event Not Viewed
marie@g-it.us

DESIGNS THAT COMPUTE, INC.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

susan@visionality.com

DELCOM GROUP, L.P.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

LLILES@delcomgroup.com

DEA SPECIALTIES CO., INC.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

awright@deaspecialties.com

DREAM RANCH, LLC (Dream Ranch Office Supplies)

Progress Event Not Viewed

sheri@dreamranchtx.com

ONSITE AV SERVICE PARTNERS INC

Progress Event Not Viewed

karla@onsiteav.com

TAKE TWO TECH, INC (Audio Visual Network)

Progress Event Not Viewed

brenda@audio-visualnetwork.com

Full Spectrum Production

Progress Response In Progress



office@weststarcorp.co

Aspec Qatar

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

shiva@aspec-int.com

J-TECH DIGITAL INC

Progress Intention Not Declared

jwang@jtechdigital.com

BROCK TECHNOLOGY GROUP LLC

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

kevin@brockav.com

Education Management Solutions, LLC

Progress Intention Not Declared

Patrick Mendelsohn
patrick.mendelsohn@simulationig.com

Mannai Trading Company WLL

Progress Event Not Viewed

waseem.shahnawaz@mannai.com.ga

DATA PROJECTIONS INC

Progress Submitted
Total Bid 387,721.42

KRIS BEGNAUD
KBEGNAUD@DATAPROJECTIONS.COM

SKC COMMUNICATION (SKC Communication Products, LLC)

Progress Event Not Viewed

erin.belenky@skccom.com

GOLDEN TRIANGLE MINORITY BUSINESS COUNCIL

Progress Event Not Viewed

Beverly Hatcher
hatcher.beverly@gtmbc.com

CHAUDHRY CONSULTING, LLC

Progress Event Not Viewed

Sherry@ChaudhryConsulting.com

MICRO TECHNOLOGIES INC (Computer Express)

Progress Event Not Viewed



robert@cetx.com

Women's Business Council - Southwest (Women's Business Council Southwest)

Progress Intention Not Declared

Sade Atkinson
satkinson@wbcsouthwest.org

DFW Minority Supplier Development Council

Progress Event Not Viewed

Edwin Cruz
sourcing@dfwmsdc.com

AVEX, LLC

Progress Event Not Viewed

jake@avexav.net

ARBER, INC.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

corporate@arberinc.com

PROFESSIONAL AUDIO/VIDEO SERVICE, INC. (Same)

Progress Event Not Viewed

apirwani@swbell.net

ANGELO TITAN TECHNOLOGY SYSTEMS LLC

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

nmedellin@angelotitantech.com

AV CALIBRATIONS, LLC

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

Nancy@avcalibrationstx.com

FORD AUDIO-VIDEO SYSTEMS LLC

Progress Event Not Viewed

tulbj@fordav.com

AUSTINVRLAB LLC

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

ali@austinvrlab.com

AUDIO DYNAMICS INC

Progress Invitation Unaccepted



Fermin@audiodynamicsinc.com

MODERN HOME

Progress Submitted
Total Bid 890,878.00

eeid@darwishholding.com

BECKWITH ELECTRONIC ENGINEERING CO.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

TSCHLUTER@BEEC.COM

AZBELL ELECTRONICS

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

ca@azbellelectronics.com

AVID CONTROLS, INC.

Progress Invitation Unaccepted

Isavell@avidcontrolsinc.com

IT DEVICES ONLINE INC (IT Consultancy Services)
Progress No Bid

Ryan Henry
rhenry@itdevicesonline.com




Internal Notes & Attachments
Note Added By Cherise Toler at 10/20/2020 2:59 PM

Patty - so many brands on this request, we asked the end-user to provide a sole source for each brand but refused
to provide it, he is claiming we didn't ask for it before (I remember we did) so he wants us to send as ease. They
clearly said they will only accept equivalent brands on the projector and projector screens but said he will provide
sole source if you ask.. we already asked but obviously he didn't want to listen to us so please go ahead and bid out
with "or equivalent" and let him "work" on the justification during the award. Thank you! -Maricel

Note Added By Cherise Toler at 10/20/2020 2:59 PM
127143213 - Brand Sole Source.pdf

18%11?2%31? - Brand Sole ../Attachments/NotesAttachments/127143213 - Brand Sole Source.pdf

Note Added By Cherise Toler at 10/20/2020 2:59 PM
127143213 - PR-7297 Techno Q - Detailed Specs (updated).docx

127143213 - PR-7297 Techno Q ../Attachments/NotesAttachments/127143213 - PR-7297 Techno Q -
- Detailed Specs (updated).docx Detailed Specs (updated).docx

Note Added By Cherise Toler at 10/20/2020 2:59 PM
127143213 - PR-7297 Techno Q - Detailed Specs.docx

127143213 - PR-7297 Techno Q ../Attachments/NotesAttachments/127143213 - PR-7297 Techno Q -
- Detailed Specs.docx Detailed Specs.docx

Note Added By Cherise Toler at 10/20/2020 2:59 PM
127143213 - PR-7297 Techno Q.pdf

52;;?3213 - PR-7297 Techno ..IAttachments/NotesAttachments/127143213 - PR-7297 Techno Q.pdf

Note Added By Cherise Toler at 10/20/2020 2:59 PM
127143213 - Suggested Vendors List.docx

127143213 - Suggested ../Attachments/NotesAttachments/127143213 - Suggested Vendors
Vendors List.docx List.docx



Q&A Board
Subject = VPAT for Panasonic Lens (Signal Perfection, LTD)

Q: Panasonic does not have a VPAT available for lenses

separately. They only have VPATSs on the projectors as

the projectors would not work without the lens. Will the Question added by: Mike Lopez
VPAT for the PT-RZ770U be sufficient for both

requirements?

No Answer

Subject = LECTURE HALL 143, 144 & 238 - Audio System (Panoutron Trading &
Contracting WLL)

Q: Item# 10 Ceiling Mount Speaker, 16W@100V (White)

Model: SF 3CT LP Brand: Extron Item#15 Four Channel

Amplifier - 200 Watts Per Channel Model: XPA 2004

Brand: Extron Item#16 SpeedMount Two-Way Surface

Mount Speakers with 6.5" Woofer Model: SM 26 Brand:  Question added by: Parag Kothari
Extron The above items are a mix of 100V and Low

Impedance systems. Kindly confirm if we can proceed

with entire Audio System as a distributed 100V system

which is suited for this kind of application.

No Answer

Subject = LECTURE HALL 238 - Surface Mount Speakers (Panoutron Trading &
Contracting WLL)

Q: Item 43 is mentioned as "SpeedMount Two-Way
Surface Mount Speakers with 8" Woofer Model:
AD-S6T-WH Brand: Extron" However, the model
specified is a QSC model and not Extron. Kindly clarify
whether you want us to use Extron SM28(T) or the one
from QSC?

No Answer

Question added by: Rami Younis

Subject = Request for Extension (MANNAI TRADING CO. WLL)

Q: We would request you to kindly allow us to submit our
proposal until 03.12.2020.

A: Hello Mr. Kuruvilla. Please confirm that you are
requesting to extend the bid to December third?

Question added by: Manish Kuruvilla

Answered by: Cherise Toler

Q: Yes. We request extension until 03 Dec 2020. Question added by: Manish Kuruvilla

No Answer

Q: May | follow up for the Extension request. We request
you to kindly allow us extension until 03 Dec 2020.

A: Hello, the bid has been extended to December 10,
2020.

Question added by: Manish Kuruvilla

Answered by: Cherise Toler

Subject = Technical Queries No.02 (MANNAI TRADING CO. WLL)

Q: As per the Tender Addendum, its mentioned about
the CAD drawings, but no CAD drawings are available. Question added by: Manish Kuruvilla
Kindly share the CAD drawings.

Addendum 3.pdf - ../Attachments/QABoardAttachments/Addendum 3.pdf

A: Hello, they should be in the attachments section now.
Please look on the second page of "Supplier
Attachments" section.

Answered by: Cherise Toler

Subject = VPAT for Poly Line Items 50 & 51 (Signal Perfection, LTD)

Q: Is there a reason a VPAT is needed for Poly line
items 50 & 51, in discussion with Poly they do not have
VPATSs available on subscription based licensing like the
1080P license or the One Year Premier RealPresence
Service agreement. Are these VPATSs required and if so
please elaborate on what exactly you are looking to
confirm so that we can share with Poly and attempt to
answer as best to our ability.

Question added by: Mike Lopez
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No Answer

Subject = Clarifications for AV Upgrade RFQ (Amisa Trading Contracting and Services
WLL)

Q: 1. We need product specifications of the project

Elevator and the height required for Maintenance

purposes for Room 238 Projector. 2. We need to know

what equipment is going to be transferred from the

current standing racks to the new podium racks in the Question added by: Mohammad Sultan
lecture halls 143 & 144. 3. We need the Autocad

Drawings for the lecture halls as discussed during the

site visit. 4. Which current rack items will be integrated

with the new system.

No Answer

Subject = Technical Queries No.01 (MANNAI TRADING CO. WLL)

Q: Dear Sir, Kindly find attached Technical Queries, for

your kind response Thanks & Regards Question added by: Manish Kuruvilla

Private Thread

11/10/2020 2:09 AM CST

Private Thread

11/9/2020 8:21 AM CST

Technical Queries No. 01.xIsx - ../Attachments/QABoardAttachments/Technical Queries No. 01.xIsx

No Answer



